REVISED - 10/3/19

AGENDA
REGULAR MEETING OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL
October 8, 2019
CITY HALL
414 High Street

7:00 P.M. - Mayor David Genshaw calls the Regular Meeting to order.
- Invocation
- Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag of the United States of
America.
- Changes to agenda for this meeting.
- Approval of minutes of the regular meeting on September
24, 2019.

ALL ITEMS ON THIS AGENDA MAY OR MAY NOT BE VOTED ON.

CORRESPONDENCE:

1. Present for information a letter from Todd Lawson, County
Administrator, acknowledging the City’s request to proceed
with acceleration of the interceptor sewer line replacement
project. The required addendum to the executed agreement
between the City and the County will be presented to the
Council at a future date.

NEW BUSINESS:

1. Present for a first reading; proposed changes to Chapter 4 of the
Municipal Code related to “Buildings”.

2. Present for a first reading; proposed changes to Chapter 9 of the
Municipal Code related to “Plumbing”.

3. Present for approval a proposal to renovate portions of the City
owned building located at 400 High Street, GMB office complex,
to accommodate additional employee office space.

4. Mayor David Genshaw to present for approval a revised
appointment to the 911 Services Evaluation Committee that was
required due to a scheduling conflict.

OLD BUSINESS:

1. Present for consideration proposed language revisions and
monetary limits changes to section 14 - Contracts and Section
37 - Floating Debt, of the City of Seaford Charter.



Page 2
AGENDA

REGULAR MEETING OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL
October 8, 2019

REMINDER OF MEETINGS & SETTING NEW MEETINGS:

1. 911 Services Evaluation Committee Meeting #2, October 15,
2019, 6:00 p.m., City Hall Council Chambers.

2. Public Power Week, October 6-12, 2019.

COMMITTEE REPORTS:

Police & Fire - Councilman Dan Henderson
Administration - Councilman Orlando Holland

Code, Parks and Recreation - Councilman James King
Public Works & WWTF - Councilman Matt MacCoy
Electric - Councilman William Mulvaney

v WwN -

Mayor Genshaw solicits a motion to adjourn the regular Council
meeting.

NOTE: Agenda shall be subject to change to include or delete
additional items (including executive session) which arise at the time
of the meeting. (29 Del. C. S1004 (e) (3))

Date Posted: 10/3/19

Posted by: TNT



_—
|2+ %=\

Suggex County

DELAWARE
sussexcountyde.gov

TODD F. LAWSON
COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

(302) 855-7742 T
(302) 855-7749 F
tlawson@sussexcountyde.gov

September 24, 2019

The Honorable David Genshaw
Mayor of the City of Seaford
P.O. Box 1100

Seaford, DE 19973 D -
S V)

Dear Mayor Genshaw:

During its September 24, 2019, County Council meeting, Council considered the City of
Seaford’s request to accelerate the interceptor sewer line replacement project.

After careful consideration, Council approved the City’s request and authorized County
Engineer Hans Medlarz to proceed with the construction project. The approval was in
accordance with the executed agreement for wastewater services between the County and
Seaford. An addendum to the executed agreement will be considered and approved by
Council at a future date.

The County looks forward to its continued partnership with the City and the success of
this project. If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerély,

To . Lawson
County Administrator

pc: The Honorable Michael H. Vincent
Mr. Hans M. Medlarz, P.E.
Mr. Charles Anderson

COUNTY ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICES
2 THE CIRCLE | PO BOX 589
GEORGETOWN, DELAWARE 19947




M?/W |

ORDINANCE #2019-2?

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD, an ordinance to amend
Chapter 4, of the Municipal Code of Seaford, Delaware relating to “Buildings”, in the manner

following, to wit:

Chapter 4, Article 1, of the Municipal Code of Seaford, Delaware is hereby amended by striking out
all of said ARTICLE 1 and substituting in lieu thereof a new ARTICLE 1 to read as shown on the
following pages.

?2?2/?2/2019 Date of First Reading

??/?2/2019 Date of Second Reading & Adoption

??7/?72/2019 Date of Advertisement

?2?2/??2/2019 Date the Ordinance is Effective

CITY OF SEAFORD

By: Witness:
Mayor

Attest:
City Manager




CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

ARTICLE 1 - BUILDING CODE

[Amended on 06/11/2013 by Ordinance #2013-04]
[Amended on 12/09/2014 by Ordinance #2014-02)
[Amended on 00/00/0000 by Ordinance #0000-00]

§4.1.1 Tite.

This article shall be known as the “Building Code of the City of Seaford, Delaware”.

§4.1.2  Adoption of Building Code.

A

The International Building Code, 2069 2018 edition with amendments, and including
all referenced codes, as published by the International Code Council, is hereby
adopted as the Building Code of the City of Seaford, in the State of Delaware for
regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings
and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and
other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe,
sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and
structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures
as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of said Building Code on file in the office of the Building Official of the City of
Seaford, Delaware are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if they
were fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and
changes, if any, prescribed in § 4.1.3 through § 4.1.7 of this Code.

At least one (1) copy of this Code shall be on file in the office of the City Building
Official for public inspection and use.

Any and all existing ordinances or parts of ordinances in confiict herewith are hereby
repealed.

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any
reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this ordinance. The City of Seaford hereby declares that it
would have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections,
sentences, clauses and phrases be declared invalid.

Nothing in this ordinance or in the Building Code hereby adopted shall be construed
to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or
liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act
or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in § 4.1.2 (C) of this ordinance; nor shall any
just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this
ordinance.

The City Manager is hereby ordered and directed to cause this ordinance to be
published.

This ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and

ARTICLE 1
BUILDING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

effect thirty (30) days from and after the date of its advertisement in a newspaper of
local circulation.

§4.13 Amendments to the 2009-2018 International Building Code (IBC).

A. The following sections are hereby revised:

1.

§101.1

§101.43

§ 103

§ 103.1

§103.2

§104.9.1

Delete: INAME-OFJURISBIGHON], Insert: the City of Seaford,
Delaware

Delete: the-pFewaensref—Ghe%temaaenaHlnvate-Sewage-D;spesaJ
- Insert: All

references within this Code to the international anate Sewage
Disposal Code are hereby deleted with this amendment, refer to the
2008 2018 International Plumbing Code (IPC), as adopted in the
Code of the City of Seaford § 9.1.2..

Delete Title: BERARTMENT-OF-BUHLDING-SAFEFY, Insert: CODE
DEPARTMENT

Delete: Bepartment-of-Building-Safety, Insert: Code Department

Insert at the end of the paragraph: All references within this Code, to
“Department of Building Safety”, are hereby deleted and replaced
with “Code Department”.

i Insert No
permlts shall be |ssued by the Bundlng Oﬁ" clal unless the structure to
be erected, constructed, enfarged, altered, repaired, moved or
emplaced shall be of new materials and equipment.

§ 105.2, Building: (1) Delete: toeland-storage-sheds;
§ 105.2, Building: (2) Delete: Ferees-ret-over6ifeat 4182001 3 4mpm)

high-, Insert: The repair and or replacement of a
roofing material, i.e. shingles, underiayment paper,
metal roofing, down to but not including roof
sheathing, however, If any part of the roof structure or
roof sheathing is in need of repair or replacement, a
permit is required.

§ 105.2, Building: (6) Delete: Sidevala-and-drvevaysnetmere-thansd

wehes{F82-rmmichove-grade-and-rotoverany
aeeessibleroute:, Insert: Deleted.

10. § 105.2, Building: (9) Delete: Prefabricatedswiramingpeslsescasser-te-a

ARTICLE 1
BUILDING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

entirely-abeve-ground:, Insert: Deleted.

11.§105.2.3 2 Delete: public-service-agensies-by-established-right., Insert;

12.§105.3

13.§109.1
14.§109.2
15.§ 109.4
16.§ 109.5

17.§109.6

18.§113.1

19.§1133

20.§1612.3

the City of Seaford.

Delete: applisant, Insert: property owner, or his duly authorized
representative

Delete: preseribed-by-taw, Insert: as established by City Council
Delete: applicable-governing-authority, Insert: City Council
Delete: buitding-official, Insert: City Council

Delete: preseribed-by-taw, Insert: as established by City Council

Delete: Refunds—The buildingofficiabis-authorized-to-establisha
refund-peliey: Insert: Deleted.

wﬂsd‘etoen- lnsert Deleted

Delete: HNSERT-NAME-OFJURISDIGHON], Insert: the City of Seaford,

Delaware

Delete: HNSERT-DATE-OFISSUANGE], Insert: June 16, 1995

21834422 Delete-Strustures existing-prorto | DATE TOBE INSERTED BY- THE

22.§1612.4

JHRISBICTHON  MOTE 4T 1S BEGOMMERBED- FHAT FHES BATE
COMNCIDEWITH THE EFFECTIVE DATE-OF BUILDING COBES WITHIN
THE JURISDICHON Hrser:-Exisng strustures, as interproted by the
Building Official,

Insert after § 1612.4:

1612.4.1 Elevation requirements.

The minimum elevation requirements shall be as specified in ASCE
24 or the base flood elevation plus eighteen inches (18"), whichever
is higher.

§4.1.4  Amendments to the 2008 2018 International Residential Code (IRC).

A. The following sections are hereby revised:

1. §R101.1 Delete: INAMEOFRJLURISDIGCHON], Insert: the City of Seaford,

Delaware

ARTICLE 1
BuUILDING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD

CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

2. §R103  Delete Title: DEPARTMENT-OFBUILDING-SAFETY, Insert: CODE

DEPARTMENT

3. §R103.1 Delete: DepartmentofBuilding-Safety, insert: Code Department

Insert at the end of the paragraph: All references within this Code, to
“Department of Building Safety”, are hereby deleted and replaced
with “Code Department”.

4. §R103.2

Insert: .hlred by the Clty Manager

5. §R104.9.1 Delete: Used-materials,equipmentand-devicesshalibnotbe

Insert: No

reusee-unlossapproved-y-the-bulldingefficial,

permits shall be issued by the Building Official unless the
structure to be erected, constructed, enlarged, aitered,
repaired, moved or emplaced shall be of new materials and
equipment.

6. §R105.2, Building: (1)

7. §R105.2, Building: (2)

8. § R105.2, Building: (5)

9. §R105.2, Building: (7)

10. § R105.2, Building: (10)

Delete %%Mw

Inser’(: Deleted.

Delete: Ferses-hrotoveri /-feet{ L5202 L2 4mm)
high:, Insert: The repair and or replacement of a
roofing material, i.e. shingles, underlayment paper,
metal roofing, down to but not including roof
sheathing, however, If any part of the roof structure or
roof sheathing is in need of repair or replacement, a
permit is required.

Delete: Sidewalks-and-drivewaysnetmere-than-30
aRy-basement-orstor-belows Insert: Deleted.

Delete: Prefabricated-swimmingpools-thatareless
than-24-inches-{610-mm)-deep:, Insert: Deleted.

Delete: Besks-notexceeding 200-sgquarefeet
by-SestionR3114- Insert: Deleted.

11. § R105.2.3 Delete: publis-service-agensiesby-established-ughi,
Insert: the City of Seaford.
12.§ R105.3 Delete: applicant, Insert: property owner, or his duly
authorized representative
13. § R108.1 Delete: preseribed-by-law, Insert: as established by City

Council

ARTICLE 1
BUILDING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD

CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

14.§ R108.2

15.§ R108.4

16.§ R108.5

17.§ R108.6

18.§ R112.1

19.§R112.3

20.§ R313.2

21.§R313.2.1

22.Table R301.2(1)

Delete: applicable-governing-authority, Insert: City Council

Delete: preseribed-by-aw, Insert: as established by City
Council

Delete: RefundsThe-buildingeffisiabsauthenzed-to
establish-arefund-peliey- Insert: Deleted.

Delete: applicable-governingautherty, Insert: City Council

ai-e-pleasures, Insert the Clty COuncll
Delete: adepirsles-efprecedure-forsendushnsishbusiness

net—empleyees—ef—the—;uﬂsmeﬁen- Insert Deleted
Delete: Nm&w i

dwe 1hes . Ona- and twoa-lamily dwellingsautematic-fre
b Efipbiea dat i 1200 L an antomatis Fasa et
wmwmm%wm—am two—family

WMW&W&M&
m&ndenﬁal—apﬂnlder—sﬁtem—, Insert-One and two family

dwelling unit fire sprinkler systems shall not be required per
this Section R313.2 in The City of Seaford, but if a dwelling

unit fire sprinkler system is installed, said installation shall
comply with the reguirements of Section P2904 or NFPA 13D

s applicable,

Delete: Designand-inctaliabion—futomaticresidentialtiize
) bt . B '

Delete the table, footnotes to remain, and insert the following
table:

TABLE R301 2(1)

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

| Formatted: Tab stops: 25", let

e
( Formatted: Indent Left: 2.5%, No bullets or numbenng ]

( Formatted: Not Strikethrough B ]

( Formatted: Font: Boid, Not Strikethrough ]

| Formatted: Indent: Left: 0" ]

WIND DI

ESIGN

SUBIECT TO DAMAGE FROM

Topographic
effectst

Special | Windboine
wind debris
regiont zone’

SEISMIC
RESIGN
CATEGORY!

Frostfine WINTER |  ICE BARRIER AR
Weathering? 2% | Temmite: | DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT | FLOOD | FREEZING
TEMPe REQUIRED" HAZARDSY INDEX:

NO

No No

A

SEVERE Bottom Moderate | 14°F YES {required at | YES (refer 358
of alf to Heavy all Yaileys and to most

foatings 24" in from current

must be edge of faves] | Community
24° NEIP Maps

ARTICLE 1
BuIlLDING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD

CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

minimum and
below Studies)
finish
grade
Maquat J Design Critersa®
factor temperature coolipg difference
52 39 19 90 1,000 12 5 54
i Wind velocity wind v i incident wet bulb aily tan| Winter humidity Summer humidity
difference heating
16 75 M 30% 50%
TABLE-R301-2(1)
CLIMATIC-AND GEOGRARHIC DESIGN GRITERIA
WIND DESIGN SUBJECT-TO-DAMAGE FROM
GROUND : SEISMIC . WINTER IGE-BARRIER AR MEAN
show | SREED< DESIGHN " . Feost-hne . 2= P FREEZING | ANNUAL
LOAD {mph} effoots GATEGORY depth® ¢ TEMPe REQUIRED” HAZARDSS INDEX TEMR
20 100 NO A SEVERE Bottom-ofall | Moderate | 16°F | YES{requiredat | ¥ES-freferto 376 B7F
BbHe) footings-must to Heavy all-valleys-and MOSL-Ourent
24" 24 i o .
i edge of Eaves) MNEEMans
below-firish and-Studies)
grade

23. § P2603.65.1.

24.§R322.2.1

Delete:{iNUMBERHRehes{mm), Insert: twenty four (24) inches
Delete:{NUMBER}HRehes{mmy), Insert: twenty four (24) inches

Delete:
4-Buidings-and stiustures in floed hasard areas,

Aumberis-netspecified:
3-Basementficorsthatare-below-grade on-allsides
shall be elevated-to or above-base Hesd-elevabion
pls: Lfeet439§mm} -or the design flood elevation;

d

4--Bulldings-and-strustures-n-Hoo
h&m&dﬂﬁgﬂa&e&%w Zones shallhave
tradowask Homoobnatad 5o of abave the design flasd
elewation.
2. Buildings and structures inflood hazard areasdesignated
ab GoaststA ZeRen shatl hava-thedowast fears alevated 1o e
above-the base floed-elevationplus 1 fool (305-min}, orte
the design Hood alevabes, whiehavar i figher,
3-4rareas-efshallow-flooding A0 Zones)-bulldingsand
structures shall have the lowest floor Hincluding basement)
elevated atlzast a5 high abeve the hihast adiasent grade as
Hisddepihageahor cpacifed in feabon the RV o151 leas! 7

fest {B10-mmi e dapihnumberis nol specified.

ARTICLE 1
BuiLDING CODE




l

|

CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD

CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

§4.15

§4.16

4. Basemant flosrs that are below grade en all sides shall-be
clovated te 8 ebave Hhe dersgr oadalovativh

Insert:

1. Buildings and structures in flood hazard areas, including
flood hazard areas designated as Coastal A Zones, shall have
the lowest floors elevated to or above the base flood
elevation plus eighteen inches (18), or the design flood
elevation, whichever is higher.

2. In areas of shallow flooding (AO Zones), buildings and
structures shall have the lowest floor (including basement)
elevated at least as high above the highest adjacent grade as
the depth number specified in feet on the FIRM, plus eighteen
inches (18"), or at least 3 feet 6 inches if a depth number is
not specified.

3. Basement floors that are below grade on all sides shall be
elevated to or above the base flood elevation plus eighteen
inches (18"), or the design flood elevation, whichever is
higher.

Amendments to the 2009 2018 International Plumbing Code (IPC).

Refer to the Code of the City of Seaford § 9.1.2.

Amendments to the 2609-2018 International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC).

A. The following sections are hereby revised:

1. §101.1.

2. §102.3.

3. §103

4. §103.1

5. §103.2

6. §103.5.

Delete: INAME-OEJURISDICTON], Insert: the City of Seaford,
Delaware

Delete: Nothingin-this-code-chall-be-construe canceh-modify-c

Delete Title: BERARTMENT-OF-RRORERTY-MAINTENANGE
INSRECHON, insert: CODE DEPARTMENT

Delete: departmentof property-maintenance-inspection, Insert: Code
Department

Delete: sede-sffisiat, Insert: Building Official

Insert at the end of the paragraph: All references within this Code, to
“Department of Property Maintenance Inspection”, are hereby
deleted and replaced with “Code Department”. All references within
this Code, to “code official”, are hereby deleted and replaced with
“Building Official”.

Delete:-Fh Ag
autherity-of the-jurisdiction, Insert: The Building Official shall be hired
by the City Manager

Delete: sehedule-BURISDICTHON-TO-INSERT-ARRRORRIATE
SGHEDULE ],

ARTICLE 1
BuiLDING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFOQRD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

Insert:

A. When the City of Seaford has affected the abatement of a
violation by its own employees or has paid for the abatement of
such violation by its agents or contractors, the actual costs
thereof and any related expenses along with an administrative
fee of one hundred dollars ($100.00) shall be charged to the
owner of such property and, if not sooner paid, such charge will
be carried on the records of the City of Seaford and shall be
collectible in the same manner as real estate taxes are collected.

B. When the City of Seaford has, for the second time and any
additional times at such property, effected the abatement of a
violation by its own employees or has paid for the abatement of
such violation by its agents or contractors, the actual costs
thereof and any related expenses along with an administrative
fee of five hundred doliars ($500.00) shall be charged to the
owner of such property and, if not sooner paid, such charge will
be carried on the records of the City of Seaford and shall be
collectible in the same manner as real estate taxes are collected.

C. Interest on all outstanding balances owed to the City shall be
charged at the rate of eighteen percent (18%) per annum to be
applied thirty (30) days following the date of completion of the
work. If not paid by the owner or occupier thereto, said bill shall
be charged to the owner or occupier of such property.

7. §105.4
Insert No permlts shall be lssued by the Busldlng Ofﬁclal unless the
structure to be erected, constructed, enlarged, altered, repaired,
moved or emplaced shall be of new materials and equipment.

8 §111.2

Delete Ihe—beard—shaﬂ-b&appewﬁed—by—the—emef-aepemﬁmg

9. §111.2.1 Delete: Aternato-mermbers-—The-chief-appeinting-autherity-shall

Insert: Deleted.

10. § 111.2.2 Delete: shall-arnuall selestone-ef-iismermbersis-core-as
chairman. Insert: chairman shall be the Mayor.

11.8§111.2.4 Delete:
te. Insert: City Manager shall

ARTICLE 1
BUILDING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

12.§112.4 Delete: [AMOUNT}-dolars, Insert: one hundred dollars ($100.00)
Delete: [AMOUNT}-dollars, Insert: five hundred dollars ($500.00)

13.§ 302.4 Delete: furisdiction-to-insert-heightininches), Insert: ten (10) inches

14. § 304.14. Delete:-Buringthe-period-from{DATE}to-{DATE];

15.8§ 602.3. Delete: during the-period-from-{DATE]to-[DATE}

16.§602.4. Delete: during-the-period-frorm{DATE}Ho{DATE}

§4.1.7 Amendments to the 2609-2018 International Energy Conservation Code (I[ECC).
A. The following sections are hereby revised:

1. §C101.1. Delete: INAMEOFJURISBIGHON], Insert: the City of Seaford,
Delaware

2. §1074.2 Delete: applicable-geverning-autherity, Insert: City Council  Formatted: Font: Not Bold e
§ C1074.3 Delete: code-official, Insert: City Council

> w

§ C10+74.4 Delete: preseribed-by-law, Insert: as established by City Council

o

§ C1074.5 Delete: Refunds-—The-cede-officiaHs-autherized-to-establish-arefund
peliey: Insert: Deleted.

6. §C108.4 Delete: AMOUNT-dollarsapplicable-governing-authority, Insert: one
hundred-doltars-{$100.00)City Council.

— Delete- [AMOUNT] dotars, tnsert:five-hundred doliars {$5600.00)

7. §C109.1 Delete: appei g
pleasures, Insert: the Clty 00uncn

8. §C109.3 Delete 4

ef-the-;uﬂseoeeen—lnsert Deleted i [ l-'orrnatted Font: Not Boid o )
) 2 [ Formatted: List Paragraph, No bullets or numbering, Adjust |
9. §R101.1. Delete: INAME-OFJURISDICTION], Insert: the City of Seaford, |space between Latin and Asian text, Adjust space between
Delaware | Asian text and numbers, Tab stops: Not at 1.25"
10.§ R104.2  Delete; applicablegoverning authority, Insert: City Council ( Formatted: Font: Not Boid )

11. § R104.3 Delete: sode-offisial, Insert: City Council

13. § R104.5 Delete: Refunds-The-gode-officiabis-authorized-to-establish-arafund

poliey- Insert: Deleted.

ARTICLE 1
BUILDING CODE



CODE QF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

15.8 R109.1 Delete: appei e iAg-
pleasure:, Insert: the City Council.

8:16. § R109.3Delete: Qualifications-The beard-of appeals shall-consist-of members [ Formatted: Indent: Left: 0.88"

whe-are quatified by experensa and treumpa aad are nol 2mpleyess of
theurisdietien—Insert: Deleted.

§4.1.8 through § 4.1.99 RESERVED

ARTICLE 1
BuiLDING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

ARTICLE 2 - NUMBERING OF BUILDINGS
[Amended on 06/11/2013 by Ordinance #2013-04]

§4.21

§4.22

§4.23

§4.24

Purpose.

The purpose of this Article is to require the clear display of properly assigned address
numbers on every residential, commercial and/or industrial building as well as individual
units within those buildings. This will support the enhanced 911 system by assisting
emergency service personnel and the general public in identifying any property during an
emergency.

Numbers designated by the City.

A

It shall be the duty of the property owner to obtain the street address for a building
from the City Building Official.

Properties that are currently annexed into the City, which are surrounded by
properties with the current City addressing format, shall be assigned an address to
coincide with the current City addressing format.

Properties that are currently annexed into the City, which are surrounded by
properties with the current Sussex County addressing format, shall be assigned an
address to coincide with the current Sussex County addressing format.

Properties along Sussex Highway shall be addressed by Sussex County.

Properties that are annexed into the City in the future shall be evaluated by the
Building Official on a case by case basis with regard to their inclusion into the State
of Delaware E911 system.

In all cases, the City Building Official shall confer with the Post Master of the US Post
Office, Seaford, Delaware as well as the Sussex County Mapping & Addressing
Department for their concurrence on the assignment of an address prior to issuance.

Responsibility of owners.

A

NO Certificate of Occupancy shall be issued until the assigned Property number has
been displayed in accordance with the requirements of this Ordinance.

All buildings used for residential, commercial, institutional or governmental purposes
shall be provided with an address identifying the buildings.

It shall be the responsibility of the property owner, trustee, lessee, agent and/or
occupant of each building to display address numbers of said building as required
under this Article and to maintain such numbers at all times.

Placement of numbers.

The following requirements for the placement of numbers shall apply:

A. On residential structures:

ARTICLE 2
NUMBERING OF BUILDINGS



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

§4.25

§4.26

§4.2.7

1. All entrances from public streets to buildings fronting thereon shall be numbered
as provided in this Article. The numbers shall be placed in the immediate area of
each entrance.

2. The numbers shall be clearly visible from the center line of the street; mounted in
a secure manner on the front wall or porch.

3. All address numbers shall be a minimum of three (3) inches in height. They shall
be placed to read from left to right or vertically from top to bottom.

4. On the mailbox of residential structures the numbers shall be three (3) inches in
height and made of light reflective numbers.

B. On all industrial and commercial structures:

1. Address numbers shall be displayed not less than ten (10) inches in height.
When possible, the number shall be displayed beside or over the main entrance
of the structure. In higher density commercial areas, the height of the numbers
may be reduced only with the approva! of the Building Official.

2. Whichever method is chosen, the address must clearly identify which structure
the address belongs to and must be visible from both sides of the street or road
during both daylight and nighttime hours.

Visibility.
A.  Numbers should be of reflective material or of sufficient visual contrast to the

background material to be easily discernible with the aid of an emergency vehicle
spotlight.

Multiple entrances and/or buildings.

A

Where a structure has more than one entrance serving separate occupants, a
separate number should be posted on, above or to the side of the doorway to each
unit. The building number must be clearly visible on each building and each
apartment or condominium sufficiently labeled with individual and specific numbers.

Where there are multiple buildings at the same address, each building shall have
posted the building number.

Commercial or Industrial facilities with rear doors that service separate tenants shall
have these access points labeled with individual and specific numbers a minimum of
three (3) inches in height.

Notice to comply.

A

The City Building Official or his designee shall be authorized to enter upon private
property for the purposes of inspection and to give notice by personal service or
certified mail to the property owner in violation of this Ordinance directing them to
abate the situation within thirty (30) days after issuance of notice.

if the violation has not been corrected in compliance with the requirements of this
Ordinance, the property owner shall be charged with a violation of said notice and
shall be assessed a fee in the amount of fifty dollars ($50.00), A notice of the

ARTICLE 2
NUMBERING OF BUILDINGS



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

§4.2.8

§4.29

assessment of the fee shall be sent to the property owner by certified mail, return
receipt requested, and, if not sooner paid, such charge will be carried on the records
of the City of Seaford and shall be collectible in the same manner as real estate taxes
are collected.

Interest on all outstanding balances owed to the City shall be charged at the rate of
eighteen percent (18%) per annum to be applied thirty (30) days following the date of
completion of the work. If not paid by the owner or occupier thereto, said bill shall be
charged to the owner or occupier of such property.

Recorded statement constitutes lien.

A

If the fee is not paid, the Building Official shall cause to be recorded in the Finance
Department of the City a sworn statement showing the cost of the administrative fee.

The Finance Department shall charge these costs against the real estate upon which
the work was performed and bill the property owner for said charges.

Where the full amount due the City is not paid by such owner within thirty (30) days,
the City Solicitor shall file a lien against the property for all charges including but not
limited to administrative costs, court costs and reasonable attorney's fees.

Appeals.

A

Within ten (10) days from the service of notice as provided for in this Article, the
owner or his agent may file with the City Council stating in detail the reasons as to
why the action proposed by the Building Official should not be taken.

Upon receipt of such appeal, the City Coungil shall put the cause on its agenda at its
earliest convenience, notify the protestant thereof and hear the merits of the appeal.

The City Council may reserve the action of the Building Official for any error of fact or
law, or upon finding that the enforcement constitutes an undue hardship upon the
property owner which the property owner is physicaily or financially unable to comply
with.

if the protestant is dissatisfied with the decision of the City Council, he shall have the
right to appeal to a court of competent jurisdiction, provided that such appeal be
taken within thirty (30) days after the protestant is notified (either at the hearing or in
writing) of the City Council's decision.

§4.2.10 through § 4.2.99  RESERVED

ARTICLE 2
NUMBERING OF BUILDINGS



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

ARTICLE 3 - HOUSING CODE
[Amended on 06/11/2013 by Ordinance #2013-04]

§43.1

§43.2

§433

§434

Title and scope.

This Ordinance shall be known as the City of Seaford Housing Code, which establishes
minimum property maintenance standards for structures covered by this ordinance, and
is herein sometimes referred to as the “City Housing Code” or “Code” and shalt apply to
and include the entire City of Seaford, except as may be exempted by this Ordinance.

Purpose.

This Ordinance is intended to protect the public safety, health and welfare in all
residential structures and on all residential premises, as hereinafter provided by:

A

c.

Establishing minimum maintenance standards for all residential structures and
premises for basic equipment and facilities for light, ventilation, heat and sanitation,
for safety from fire; for space; and for safe and sanitary maintenance of all structures
and premises;

Fixing the responsibilities of owners, operators and occupants of all structures; and

Providing for administration, enforcement and penalties.

Applicability.

A. The provisions of the City Housing Code shall apply to all residential structures used

for human habitation. The provisions are designed to:

1. Eliminate or prevent substandard conditions with respect to structures;

2. Protect against fire hazards;

3. Provide for adeguate space for light and air;

4. Provide for proper heating and ventilating; and

5. Eliminate unsanitary conditions, and overcrowding.

Every portion of a building or premises used, or intended to be used, for residential
purposes shali comply with the provisions of this Ordinance, including hotels and
motels serving transient guests, migratory labor housing, rest homes, convalescent
homes, nursing homes, recreational campers and Civil Defense Shelters. For the

purpose of this Ordinance, regulations by the State of Department of Health and
Social Services for Migratory Labor Camps also will apply to migrant housing.

Liberal Interpretation.

A. The provisions of this entire Ordinance shall be liberally interpreted so as to minimize

displacement of persons whose dwelling units may deviate for this Ordinance’s
specifications, but do not pose an imminent threat to the health, safety and general
welfare of the occupants and other persons.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

B. Additionally, this Ordinance is to be liberally interpreted so as to minimize hardships
to persons that inhabit or own dwelling units which deviate from this Ordinance's
specifications, but pose an imminent threat to the health, safety and generai welfare
of the occupants and other persons.

§4.3.5 Exemptions.

A. This Ordinance does not replace or modify requirements otherwise established for
the construction, repair, alteration or use of buildings and facilities related thereto.

B. Nothing in this Ordinance shall be deemed to abolish or impair existing rights or
remedies of the State, County or municipality or its officers or agencies relating to the
removal or demolition of any buildings which are deemed to be unsafe or unsanitary.

C. As determined by the Building Official in any case where a provision of any other
ordinance, regulation, or statute of the State, County or municipality existing on the
effective date of this Ordinance or hereafter enacted establishes a lower standard for
the promotion and protection of the safety and health of the public, the provisions of
this Ordinance shall govern. The provisions of this Code shall apply to all existing
structures as well as future structures.

D. Hardship:

1. When the literal application of the requirements of this Ordinance would cause
undue hardships or the displacement of low income occupants with no affordable
housing alternatives, an exception may be granted by the appropriate appeals
board upon written petition under § 4.3.28.

2. Such petition shall state the reason therefore.
3. Such exceptions shall be made in writing.

4. Insuch cases where it is necessary to make safe an unsafe structure or correct
an unhealthy condition, every effort shall be made to make the necessary
corrections without causing undue hardship to the occupant or owner and
without causing the displacement of said persons.

E. Special conditions:

1. When unusual building conditions or building sites exist, an exception may be
granted by the Building Official upon written petition.

2. Such petition shall state what these special conditions are, and such exceptions
shall be made in writing and only when it is clearly evident that reasonable safe
and sanitary conditions are assured, and such exceptions shall be conditioned in
such a manner to achieve those ends.

§4.36 Definitions.

A. Words used in the present tense include the future, the singular includes the plural
and plural includes the singular. Unless otherwise expressly stated, where terms are
not defined under the provisions of this Ordinance, they shall have ascribed to them
their ordinarily accepted meanings or such as the context herein may imply.
Whenever the words “multi-family dwelling”, “residence Building”, “dwelling unit”,

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

“mobile home", or “premises” are used in this Ordinance, they shall be construed as
though they were followed by the word, “or any part thereof”.

B. The following terms are defined as listed below:
Acting Building Official: In the absence of the Building Official the Acting Building
Official shall be assigned by the City Manager and shall have the same duties and
powers granted in § 4.3.22 of this Ordinance.
Approved: Approved, as applied to material, device, or method of construction, shall
mean approved by Code Official under the provisions of this Ordinance or approved
by other authority designated by law to give approval in the matter in question.

Basement: That portion of a building which is partly below and partly above grade,
and having at least one-half (1/2) its height above grade (see “Cellar”).

Building Official: The official who is charged with the administration and enforcement
of this Ordinance, or any duly authorized representative. Whenever the words
“Building Official” are used in this Ordinance it shall also be construed as “Code
Official” and “Code Inspector”.

Cellar: That portion of a building which is partly or completely below grade, and
having at least one-half (1/2) its height below grade (see “basement”).

Central heating: The heating system permanently installed and adjusted so as to
provide the distribution of heat to all habitable rooms, bathrooms and water closet
compartments from a source outside of these rooms.

Code Inspector: A duly authorized representative of the Building Official charged with
the responsibilities of administering and enforcing this Ordinance.

Code Officer: A duly authorized representative of the Building Official charged with
the responsibilities of administering and enforcing this Ordinance.

Condemn: To adjudge unfit for residential use or human occupancy.
Condemnation: The act of judicially condemning.

Community: Any municipality in the County of Sussex.

Dwelling shall mean the following:

¢ One-family dwellings: A building containing one (1) dwelling unit with not more
than three (3) lodgers or boarders.

o Two-family dwelling: A building containing two (2) dwelling units with not more
than three (3) lodgers or boarders per family.

e Multi-family apartment house: A building or portion thereof containing more than
two (2) dwelling units and not classified as a one or two-family dwelling.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

s Boarding house, lodging house and tourist house: A building arranged or used
for lodging, with or without meals, for compensation, by more than five (5) and
not more than twenty (20) individuals.

o Dormitory: A space in a building where group sleeping accommodations are
provided in one (1) room, or in a series of closely associated rooms for persons
not members of the same family group.

¢ Hotel: Any building containing six (6) or more guest rooms intended or designed
to be used, or which are used, rented or hired out to be occupied, or which are
occupied for sleeping purposes by guests.

Dwelling Unit: A single unit providing complete, individual living facilities for one (1)
or more persons, including permanent provisions for living, sleeping, eating, cooking
and sanitation.

Enforcement Officer: The official designated herein or otherwise charged with the
responsibilities of administering this Ordinance or the official’s authorized
representative.

Exterior Property Areas: The open space on the premises and on adjoining property
under the control of owners or operators of such premises.

Extermination: The control and elimination of insects, rats or other pests by
eliminating their harborage places; by removing or making inaccessible materials
that may serve as their food; by poison spraying, fumigating, trapping, or by any other
approved pest elimination methods.

Family: An individual or married couple and the children thereof with not more than
two (2) other persons, living together as a single housekeeping unit in a dwelling unit.

Garbage: The animal and vegetable waste resulting from the handling, preparation,
cooking and consumption of food.

Habitable space: Space in a structure for living, sleeping, eating, or cooking.
Bathrooms, toilet compartments, closets, halls, storage or utility space, and similar
areas are not considered habitable space.

Hotel: See Dwellings.

Infestation: The presence, within or contiguous to a structure or premises, of insects,
rats, vermin or other pests.

Junk vehicle: Any vehicie which is without a currently valid license plate or plates and
is in either a rusted, wrecked, discharged, dismantled, partly dismantled, inoperative
or abandoned condition. A junk vehicle shall be classified as to its condition in one
(1) of the two (2) following categories:

e Restorable: A junk vehicle that is in a condition whereby repairs to same could
be made to place it in operating condition without exceeding the estimated value
when repaired.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE _OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

o Wreck: A junk vehicle in such condition that is economically unsound to restore
same to operating condition, considering the repairs to be made, age of the
vehicle, market value of the vehicle if it were restored or in such condition that it
warrants such classification.

Let for occupancy or let: To permit possession or occupancy of a dwelling, dwelling
unit, rooming unit, building or structure by a person who shall be lega! owner or not
be the legal owner of record thereof, pursuant to a written or unwritten lease,
agreement or license, or pursuant to a recorded or unrecorded agreement of contract
for the sale of land.

Maintenance: Conformance of a building and its facilities to the Code under which
the building was constructed.

Motel: A hotel as defined in this ordinance.
Multi-family (muitiple) dwellings: See Dwellings.

Occupant: Any person over one (1) year of age (including owner or operator) living
and sleeping in a dwelling unit or having actual possession of said dwelling or
rooming unit.

Openable Area: That part of a window or door which is available for unobstructed
ventilation and which opens directly to the outdoors.

Operator: Any person who has charge, care or control of a structure or premises
which are let or offered for occupancy.

Overcrowded: A dwelling shall be overcrowded when its occupancy exceeds the
maximum number of persons permitted in § 4.3.11.

Owner: Any person, firm, corporation, receiver or officer (or agent thereof) who owns,
holds or controls the whole, of any part of to freehold title (contro! of the freehold title
is not intended to mean a tenant under any type of written or oral tenancy), to any
real property, including, but not limited to, vacant land, buildings, dwelling units,
commercial real property, etc., with or without accompanying actual possession
thereof, and shall include, in addition to the holder of legal title, any vendee in
possession thereof but shall not include a mortgagee or trustee under deed or trust,
unless such mortgagee or trustee is in actual possession.

Person: Any individual, corporation or partnership.

Plumbing: The labor, materials, and fixtures used in the instailation, maintenance,
extension and alteration of all piping, fixtures, appliances and appurtenances.

Plumbing fixture: A receptacle or device, which is either permanently or temporarily
connected to the water distribution system of the premises, and demands a supply of
water therefrom; or discharges used water, liquid-borne waste materials, or sewage,
either directly or indirectly, to the drainage system of the premises; or which requires
both a water supply connection and a discharge to the drainage system of the
premises.

Premises: A lot, plot or parcel of land, including the buildings or structures thereon.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CobE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

Public Nuisance: Includes the following:

e The physical condition or use of any premises regarded as a public nuisance at
common law; or

e Any physical condition, use or occupancy of any premises or its appurtenances
considered an attractive nuisance to children, including, but not limited to,
abandoned wells, shafts, basements, excavations and unsafe fences or
structures; or

e Any premises designated as having unsanitary sewerage or plumbing facilities; or
s Any premises designated as unsafe for human habitation or use; or

e Any premises which are manifestly capable of being a fire hazard, or are
manifestly unsafe or unsecure so as to endanger life, limb or property; or

e Any premises from which the plumbing, heating or other facilities required by this
Ordnance have been removed, or from which utilities such as water, sewer, gas
and electricity have been disconnected, destroyed, removed or rendered
ineffective, or the required precautions against trespassers have not been
provided; or

e Any premises which are unsanitary, or which are littered with rubbish or garbage,
or which have an uncontrolled growth of weeds; or

e Any structure or building that is in an advanced state of dilapidation,
deterioration or decay; faulty construction; overcrowded; open, vacant or
abandoned; damaged by fire to the extent as not to provide adequate shelter, in
danger of collapse or structural failure and is dangerous to anyone on or near the
premises.

Renovation: Work on a building and its facilities to make it conform to present day
minimum standards of sanitation, fire and life safety.

Residence Building: A building in which sleeping accommodations, toilet, bathing
and cooking facilities as a unit are provided.

Rooming House: Any residence building, or any part thereof, containing one (1) or
more rooming units, in which space is let by the owner or operator to more than five
(5) persons who are not members of the family (see Dwellings, boarding house).

Rooming unit: Any room or group of rooms forming a single habitable unit used, or
intended to be used, for living and sleeping, but not for cooking or eating purposes.

Rubbish: The waste materials commonly referred to as rubbish and garbage,
including garbage from normal household living conditions, including waste, food
stuffs of vegetable or animal origin, paper products, fabrics, plastic and metal
containers, botties, crockery and other similar materials, and combustible and non-
combustible waste materials, including the residue from the burning of wood, coal,
coke, and other combustible material, paper, rags, cartons, boxes, wood excelsior,
rubber, leather, tree branches, yard trimmings, tin cans, metais, mineral matter,
glass crockery, abandoned or inoperable machinery, bottles, wastepaper, cardboard,

ARTICLE 3
HousinG CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

§4.37

§4.38

sawdust piles, rubbish from building construction or reconstruction, uprooted tree
stumps, street refuse and all other waste materials, including any abandoned
unlicensed or inoperable motor vehicle.

Structure: That which is built or constructed, including without limitation because of
enumeration, buildings for any occupancy or use whatsoever, fences, signs,
biltboards, fire escapes, chute escapes, railings water tanks, towers, open grade
steps, sidewalks or stairways, tents or anything erected and framed to component
parts, which is fastened, anchored or rests on a permanent foundation or on the
ground.

Supplied: Installed, furnished or provided by the owner or operator.

Ventilation: The process of supplying and removing air by natural or mechanical
means to or from any space.

e Natural: Ventilation by opening to outer air through windows, skylights, doors,
louvers, or stacks without wind driven devices.

o Mechanical: Ventilation by power driven devices.

Workmanlike: Whenever the words “workmanlike state of maintenance and repair”
are used in this ordinance they shall mean that such maintenance and repair shall
be made in a reasonably skiliful manner.

Yard: An open, unoccupied space on the same lot with a building extending along the
entire length of the street, or rear or interior lot line.

Coordination of Enforcement.

A.

Inspection of premises and the issuing of orders in connection therewith under the
provisions of this Ordinance shall be the exclusive responsibility of the Building
Official.

When, in the opinion of the Building Official, it is necessary or desirable to have
inspections of any conditions by any other community, County or State agency, the
Building Official shall arrange for this to be done in such a manner that the owners or
occupants of the dwelling shall not be subjected to visits by numerous inspectors nor
to multiple or conflicting orders.

No order for correction of any violation under this Section, when coordination of
enforcement is required, shall be issued without the approval of the Building Official
and, before issuing any such order, the Building Official shall obtain the concurrence
of any other department or agency having jurisdiction there over.

Minimum conditions of premises and buildings.

A. The provisions of this Article shall describe the minimum conditions of residential

premises and buildings to be used for human occupancy. Every residential building or
structure occupied by humans, except as exempted by § 4.3.3 and § 4.3.5, and its
premises shall comply with the conditions and standards herein prescribed when a
deviation from such conditions and standards pose an imminent threat to the health,
safety, and general welfare of the occupants and other persons. The Building Official

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CiTY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

may cause periodic inspection to be made of residential buildings and premises to
secure compliance with these requirements.

1.

Responsibility: The owner of buildings and premises shall maintain such
buildings and premises in compliance with these requirements. A person shall
not occupy as owner-occupant or et to another for occupancy or use premises
which do not comply with the requirements of this Section.

Accessory structures: All accessory structures, including detached garages,
fences and walls, shall be maintained structurally sound and in compliance with
§ 4.3.9 and § 4.3.10 of this article.

Containers: Garbage, vegetable wastes, or other putrescible materials shall be
stored in leak-proof containers, provided with tight fitting covers, for the storage
of such materials until removed from the premises for disposal.

Exhaust vents: Except as to previously existing and operating exhaust systems,
no person shall construct, maintain, or operate pipes, ducts, conductors, fans or
blowers discharging gases, steam, vapor, hot air, grease, smoke, odors or other
gaseous or particulated wastes so as to discharge directly upon abutting or
adjacent public or private property, or property or another tenant.

Grading and drainage: All premises shall be graded and maintained so as to
prevent the accumulation of stagnant water thereon.

Insect and rat control: All premises shall remain free of insects, rats, vermin, or
other pests in all exterior areas of the premises.

An owner shall be responsible for extermination, except that the occupant shall
be responsible for such extermination in the exterior areas of the premises of a
single-family dwelling.

Extermination in the shared or public parts of the premises of the other than a
single-family dwelling shall be the responsibility of the owner.

Motor vehicles: All premises, except as provided in other regulations, shall not
contain any unregistered or uninspected or junk vehicles that pose a threat to the
health, safety and general welfare of the occupants or other persons.

Noxious weeds: All premises in predominately residential areas shall be kept
free from weeds or plant growth, which are noxious or detrimental to the public
health and welfare, and shall be trimmed to a height of not more than ten (10)
inches.

Sanitation: All premises shall be maintained in a clean, safe and sanitary
condition free from any accumulation of rubbish or garbage.

10. Vacant structures and land: Al vacant structures and premises thereof or vacant

land shall be maintained in a clean, safe, secure, and sanitary condition as
provided herein so as not to cause blight or adversely affect the public heaith or
safety.

§4.39  Exterior structure.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

A. The exterior of a structure shall be maintained structurally sound and sanitary so as
not to pose a threat to the health and safety of the occupants and so as to protect
the occupants from the environment.

1.

Basement and window hatchways: Every basement or cellar hatchway or window
shall be so maintained as to prevent the entrance of rats, insects, rain, and
surface drainage into the structure.

Chimneys: All chimneys, cooling towers, smokestacks, and similar
appurtenances shall be maintained structurally safe, sound, and in good repair.
All exposed surfaces of metal or wood shall be protected from the elements and
against decay.

Decorative features: All cornices, trim, wall facings and similar decorative
features shall be maintained in good repair with proper anchorage and in a safe
condition.

Door hardware: Every exterior door, door hinge, and door latch shall be
maintained in good condition. Door locks in dwelling units shall be in good repair
and capable of tightly securing the door.

Exterior surfaces (foundations, walls and roof): Every foundation, exterior wall,
roof and all other exterior surfaces shall be maintained in a workmanilike state of
maintenance and repair and shalt be kept in such condition so as to exclude rats.

Exterior walls: Every exterior wall shall be free of holes, breaks, loose or rotting
boards or timbers, and any other condition which might admit rain or dampness
to the interior portions of the walls or to the occupied spaces of the building. All
exterior surface materials, including wood, composition, or metal siding, shall be
maintained weatherproof so as to prevent deterioration.

Foundation walls: All Foundation walls shall be maintained so as to carry the
safe design and operating dead and live loads, plumb and free from open cracks
and breaks, except as necessary to release excessive water pressure on the wall
so as not to be detrimental to public safety and welfare.

Glazing: Every required window sash shall be fully supplied with glazing materials
which securely hold in place window glass.

Lead based paint: Lead based paint with a lead content of more than one-half
percent (0.5%) shall not be applied to any interior or exterior surface of a dwelling
or dwelling unit, including fences and outbuildings upon any premises. Any
structure built prior to 1978 has the potential to contain lead based paint, and in
these structures peeling paint must be evaluated for lead and properiy treated
through approved methods if found.

The HUD/EPA lead-based paint disclosure rule, 1.0 milligrams per square
centimeter (mg/cm?2) or 0.5% by weight is the standard that must be used, as
defined by Title X of the 1992 Housing and Community Development Act.

10. Openable windows: Every window, other than a fixed window, shall be capabie of

being opened and shall be held in position by window hardware. One-half of the
window area is to be openable.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

11. Roofs: The roof shall be structurally sound, tight, and not have defects which
might admit rain and roof drainage, shall be adequate to prevent rain water from
causing dampness in the walls or interior portion of the building.

12. Signs, marquees, and awnings: All canopies, marquees, signs, metal awnings,
stairways, fire escapes, standpipes, exhaust ducts and similar overhang
extensions shall be maintained in good repair, shall be properly anchored so as
to be kept in a safe and sound condition, and shall be protected from the
elements and against decay.

13. Stairs and porches: Every stair, porch, balcony, and all appurtenances attached
thereto shall be so maintained as to be safe to use and capable of supporting the
loads to which it may be subjected and shall be maintained in sound condition
and repair.

14. Structural members: All supporting structural members of all structures shall be
maintained structurally sound, free of deterioration and capable of safely bearing
the dead and live loads imposed upon them.

15. Weathertight Every window and exterior door shall be fitted reasonably in its
frame and be weather tight. Weather stripping shall be used as necessary to
exclude wind or rain from entering the dwelling or structure and shall be kept in
sound condition and good repair.

16. Window and door frames: Every window, door, and frame shall be maintained, in
such relation to the adjacent wall construction, so as to exclude rain as
completely as possible and to substantially exclude wind from entering the
building.

§4.3.10 Interior Structure.

A. The interior of a structure and its equipment shall be maintained structurally sound
and in a sanitary condition so as not to pose a threat to the health and safety of the
occupants and to protect the occupants from the environment.

1. Bathroom and kitchen floors: Every toilet, bathroom and kitchen floor surface
shait be constructed and maintained so as to permit such floor to be easily kept
in a clean and sanitary condition.

2. Exit doors: Every door available as an exit shall be capable of being opened
easily from the inside.

3. Exit facilities: All interior stairs and railings and other exit facilities of every
structure shali be maintained in sound condition and good repair by replacing
treads and risers that evidence excessive wear or are broken, warped or loose,
every inside stair shall be so constructed and maintained as to be safe to use
and capable of supporting the anticipated loads.

4. Free from dampness: Cellars, basements and crawl spaces shall be maintained
free from standing water so as to prevent conditions conducive to decay or
deterioration of the structure.

5. Insectand rat harborage: All structures shall be kept free from insect and rat
infestation, and where insects or rats are found, they shall be promptly

ARTICLE 3
HoOUSING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD. CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

exterminated by acceptable processes which will not be injurious to human
health. After extermination, proper precautions shall be taken to prevent re-
infestation.

6. Interior surfaces: Floors, walls, including windows and doors, ceilings, and other
interior surfaces shall be maintained in good, clean and sanitary conditions.

7. Lead based paint: Lead based paint with a lead content of more than one-half
percent (0.5%) shall not be applied to any interior or exterior surface of a dwelling
or dwelling unit, inctuding fences and outbuildings upon any premises. Any
structure built prior to 1978 has the potential to contain lead based paint, and in
these structures peeling paint must be evaluated for lead and properly treated
through approved methods if found.

The HUD/EPA lead-based paint disclosure rule, 1.0 milligrams per square
centimeter (mg/em?) or 0.5% by weight is the standard that must be used, as
defined by Title X of the 1992 Housing and Community Development Act.

8. Sanitation: The interior of every structure shall be maintained in a clean and
sanitary condition free from any accumutation of rubbish, refuse or garbage.
Rubbish, garbage, and other refuse shall be properly kept inside temporary
storage facilities.

9. Stairs, porches and railings: Stairs, porches, railings, and other exit facilities
shall be adequate for safety.

10. Storage: Garbage or refuse shall not be allowed to accumulate or be stored in
public halls or stairways.

11. Structural members: The supporting structural members of every building shalt
be maintained structurally sound, not showing any evidence of deterioration
which would render them incapable of carrying the imposed loads.

§4.3.11 Light, ventilation and Space Requirements.

A. All spaces or rooms shall be provided sufficient light so as not to endanger health
and safety. All spaces or rooms shall be provided sufficient natural or mechanical
ventilation so as not to endanger health and safety. Where mechanical ventilation is
provided in lieu of natural ventilation, such mechanical ventilation system shall be
maintained in operation during the occupancy of any structure or portion thereof.

1. Area for sleeping purposes: Every room occupied for sleeping purposes by one
(1) occupant shall contain at least sixty-four (64) square feet of floor area.

2. Basement rooms and cellar rooms: Basement and cellar rooms partially below
grade shall not be used for sleeping purposes, unless the basement and cellar
room (or roomsy) is (are) within the specifications for sleeping rooms as provided
for in this code.

3. Common access: A habitable room, bathroom, or water closet compartment,
which is accessory to a dwelling unit, shall not open directly into or be used in
conjunction with a food store, barber or beauty shop, doctor's or dentist’s
examination or treatment room, or similar room used for public purposes.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

4. Common halls and stairways: Every common hall and stairway in every building,
other than one-family dwellings, shall be adequately lighted at all times with an
illumination of at least a sixty (60) watt light bulb. Such illumination shall be
provided throughout the normaltly traveled stairs and passageways.

5. Cooking: Primary cooking facilities shall not be permitted in any sleeping room or
dormitory unit, except for efficiency apartments.

6. Dwelling units: Every dwelling unit shall contain a minimum gross floor area of
not less than one hundred fifty (150) square feet for the first occupant, and one
hundred (100) square feet for each additional occupant. The floor area shall be
calculated on the basis of the total area of all habitable rooms.

7. Lightin habitable rooms: Every habitable room except kitchens toilet rooms,
hasement or cellar rooms, and interior rooms of town houses and row houses,
shall have at least one (1) window facing directly to the outdoors, a court or a
porch. Every habitable room, except kitchens and toilet rooms, shall have at
least one (1) door or window which can be opened to adequately ventilate the
room. Kitchens, toilet rooms without windows, basement or cellar rooms, and
interior rooms of townhouses and row houses shall have natural or mechanical
ventilation. Size of windows shall not be less than eight percent (8%) of the floor
area.

8. Minimum ceiling heights: Habitable rooms shall have a clear ceiling height over
the minimum area required by this Code at not less than seven (7) feet, four (4)
inches, except that in attics, basements, or top half stories the ceiling height shall
not be less than seven (7) feet over not less than one-third (1/3) of the minimum
area required by this Code when used for sleeping, study or similar activity. In
calculating the floor area of such rooms only those portions of the floor area of
the room having a clear ceiling height of five (5) feet or more may be included.

9. Other spaces: All other spaces shall be provided with natural or artificial light of
sufficient intensity and so distributed as to permit the maintenance of sanitary
condition, and the safe use of the space and the appliances and fixtures.

10. Overcrowding: if any room used for residential purposes is overcrowded as
defined in § 4.3.6; the Building Official may order the number of persons
sleeping or living in said room to be reduced.

11. Privacy: Hotel units, lodging units, and dormitory units shall be designed to
provide privacy and be separate from other adjoining spaces.

12. Prohibited use: It shall be prohibited to use for sleeping purposes any kitchen,
non-habitable space, or public space.

13. Separation of unit: Dwelling units shall be separate and apart from each other.
Within the exception of crib rooms or rooms accommodating handicapped
individuals, sleeping rooms shall not be used as the only means of access to
other sleeping rooms.

14. Toilet rooms: Every bathroom and water closet compartment shall comply with
the light and ventilation requirements for habitable rooms as required by
§4.3.11, (A) (7), except that a window shall not be required in bathrooms or

ARTICLE 3
HOUSING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD

. CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

water closet compartments equipped with an approved mechanical ventilation
system.

§4.3.12 Plumbing Facilities and Fixtures Requirements.

A. Every dwelling unit shall include its own plumbing facilities which are in proper
operating condition, can be used in privacy, and are adequate for personal
cleanliness and the disposal of human waste. All plumbing is to be installed in
accordance with the City Plumbing Code.

1

Access for cleaning: Plumbing fixtures shall be installed so as to permit easy
access for cleaning both the fixtures and the areas about them.

Bathtub or shower: Every dwelling unit shall contain a room which affords privacy
to a person in said room and which is equipped with a bathtub or shower
supplied with hot and cold running water.

Connections: Water supply lines, plumbing fixtures, vents and drains shall be
properly instalied connected and maintained in working order and shall be kept
free from obstructions, leaks and defects and capable of performing the function
for which they are designed. Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking
fountain, water closet or other facility shall be properly connected to either a
public sewer system or to an approved private sewage disposal system.

Contamination: The water supply shall be maintained free from contamination
and all water inlets from plumbing fixtures shall be located above the overflow
rim of the fixture.

Direct access: Toilet rooms and bathrooms shall not be used as a passageway to
a hall or other space, or to the exterior. At least one (1) toilet or bathroom in a
dwelling unit shall be accessible from any sleeping room without passing through
another sleeping room.

Floors: Bathrooms and toilet rooms shall be provided with floors of moisture
resistant material.

Hotels: Where private water closets, lavatories, and baths are not provided, one
(1) water closet, one (1) lavatory and one (1) bathtub, accessible from a public
hallway, shall be provided on each floor. Each lavatory, bathtub or shower shall
be supplied with hot and cold water at all times.

Maintenance: All plumbing facilities shall be maintained in a clean and sanitary
condition by the occupant so as not to breed insects and rats or produce
dangerous or offensive gases or odors. Every plumbing stack, waste and sewer
line shall be so installed and maintained as to function properly and shall be kept
free from obstructions, leaks and defects to prevent structural deterioration or
health hazards.

Privacy: Toilet rooms and bathrooms shall be designed and arranged to provide
privacy.

10. Rooming houses: At least one (1) water closet, lavatory basin and bathtub or

shower, properly connected to an approved water and sewer system and in good
working condition, shall be supplied for each four (4) rooms within a rooming

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE QF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

house, wherever said facilities are shared. Every lavatory basin and bathtub or
shower shall be supplied with hot and cold water at all times.

11. Same story: Toilet rooms and bathrooms serving hotel units, lodging units, or
dormitory units, unless located within such respective units, or directly connected
thereto, shall be provided on the same story with such units, and be accessible
only from a common hall or passageway.

12. Sink: Every dwelling unit shall contain a kitchen sink apart from the lavatory
required under §4.3.12, (A) (15) and shall be supplied with hot and cold running
water.

13. Storm Drainage: An approved system of storm water disposal shall be provided
and maintained for the safe and efficient drainage of roofs and paved areas,
yards and courts, and other open areas on the premises.

14. Supply: The water supply systems shall be installed and maintained to provide,
at all times, a supply of water to plumbing fixtures, devices, and appurtenances
in sufficient volume and at pressures adequate to enable them to function
satisfactorily.

15. Water closet and lavatory: Every dwelling unit shall contain a lavatory and a
water closet supplied with cold running water. The water closet shall not be
located in a habitable room. The lavatory may be placed in the same room as the
water closet, or if located in another room, the lavatory shall be located in close
proximity to the door leading directly into the room in which said water closet is
located. The lavatory shall be supplied with hot and cold running water. All
running water shall be under pressure. Water supply shall be deemed adequate
if it is capable of delivering thirty five (35) gallons per person per day to the house
at a peak of two and one half (2 ¥2) times the average hourly demand.

16. Water conservation: Plumbing fixtures which are replaced shall be of water
saving construction and use.

17. Water heating facilities: Water heating facilities shall be properly installed,
properly maintained and properly connected with hot water lines to the fixtures
required to be supplied with the hot water. Water heating facilities shall be
capable of heating water to such a temperature so as to permit an adequate
amount of water to be drawn at every required kitchen sink, lavatory basin,
bathtub, shower and laundry facility or other similar units, at a temperature of not
less than one hundred ten degrees (110°) Fahrenheit .

§ 4.3.13 Heating, cooking and refrigeration facilities.

A. Every dwelling unit and guest room shall be provided with heating facilities capable of
maintaining a room temperature of sixty-five degrees (65°) Fahrenheit at a point
three (3) feet above the floor and three (3) feet from an exterior wall in all habitable
rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms. In every dwelling unit that contains cooking and
baking facilities for the purpose of preparation of food, such facilities shall be
properly instalied by the owner and operated and kept in a clean and sanitary
working condition by the occupant.

ARTICLE 3
HousiING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

1

Clearances: All required clearances from combustible materials shall be
maintained.

Climate Control: When facilities for interior climate control (heating, cooling, or
humidity) are integral functions of structures used as dwelling units, such
facilities shall be maintained and operated in a continuous manner in
accordance with the designed capacity.

Combustion Air: A supply of air for complete combustion of the fuel and for
ventilation of the space shall be provided to the fuel burning equipment.

Cooking and heating equipment: All cooking and heating equipment
components, and accessories in every heating, cooking, and water heating device
shall be maintained free from leaks and obstructions, and kept functioning
properly so as to be free from fire, health and accident hazards.

Flue: All fuel burning equipment, designed to be connected to a fiue, chimney or
vent, shall be connected in an approved manner.

Fireplaces: Fireplaces and other devices intended for the use similar to a
fireplace, including wood and coal burning stoves, shall be stable and structurally
safe and connected to approved chimneys.

Installation: All mechanical equipment shail be properly installed and safely
maintained in good working condition, and be capable of performing the function
for which it was designed and intended.

Refrigeration: In every dwelling unit that contains a refrigeration unit for the
temporary preservation of perishable foods, such unit shall be capable of
maintaining an average temperature below forty-five degrees (45°) Fahrenheit,
and shall be properly installed by the owner and operated and kept in a clean
and sanitary working condition by the occupant.

Safety controls: All safety controls for fuel burning equipment shall be
maintained in effective operation.

§4.3.14 Electrical facilities.

A. Defective system: Where it is found, in the opinion of the Building Official, that the
electrical system in a structure constitutes a hazard to the occupants or the structure
by reason of inadequate service, improper fusing, insufficient outlets, improper wiring
or installation, deterioration or damage, or for similar reasons, the Building Official
shall require the defects to be corrected to eliminate the hazard.

B. Installation: All electrical equipment, wiring and appliances shall be installed and
maintained in a safe manner in accordance with all applicable laws. All electrical
equipment shall be of an approved type.

C. Outlets required: Where there is electric service available to a structure, the
following outiets shall be provided:

1

Habitable rooms (ALL) of a dwelling unit and every guest room:

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAFTER 4 - BUILDINGS

e Two (2) separate and remote outlets, one (1) of which may be a ceiling or wall
type electric light fixture.

Kitchen:

e Three (3) separate and remote wall type electric convenience outlets; or
e Two (2) such convenience outlets; and

e One (1) ceiling or wall type electric light fixture.

Public hall, water closet compartment, bathroom, laundry room or furnace room

e One (1) electric light fixture; and

e |n addition to the electric light fixture in every bathroom and laundry room,
there shall be provided at least one (1) electric outlet.

e Any new bathroom outlet shall have a ground fault circuit interrupter
protection.

Every such outlet shail be maintained in good and safe working condition and
shall be connected to the source or electrical power in a safe manner.

§4.3.15 Fire Safety Requirements.

A. A safe, continuous and unobstructed means of egress shall be provided from the
interior of a structure to the exterior at a street, or to a yard, court, or passageway
leading to a public open area at a grade. All fire protection and life safety devices
and equipment shall be maintained in accordance with the provisions of the Fire
Prevention Rules and Regulations of the State of Delaware, and the City of Seaford
Building Code.

1.

Accumulations: Waste, refuse, or other materials shall not be allowed to
accumulate in stairways, passageways, doors, windows, fire escapes, or other
means or egress.

Direct exit: Every dwelling unit or guest room shall have access directly to the
outside or to a public corridor.

Exit signs: All exit signs shall be maintained, illuminated and visible.

Fire alarm: Fire alarms and detecting systems shall be maintained and be
suitable for their respective purposes.

Fire escapes: All required fire escapes shall be maintained in working condition
and structurally sound.

Fire extinguishers: All portable fire extinguishers shall be visible and accessible,
and maintained in an efficient and safe operating condition.

Fire suppression system: Fire suppression systems shall be maintained in good
condition, free from mechanical injury. Sprinkler heads shall be maintained
clean, free of corrosion and paint, and not bent or damaged.

Flammable materials: Highly flammable or explosive matter, such as paints,
volatile oils, and cleaning fluids, or combustible refuse, such as wastepaper,
boxes, and rags, shall not be accumulated or stored on residential premises
except in reasonable guantities consistent with normal usage.

ARTICLE 3
HousiNG CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

9. Locked doors: All doors in the required means of egress shali be readily
openable from the inner side. Exits from dwelling units, hotel units, lodging units,
and dormitory units shall not lead through other such units, or through toilet
rooms or bathrooms.

10. Residential unit: A dwelling unit or rooming unit shall not be located within a
structure containing an establishment handling, dispensing or storing flammable
liquids with a flash point of one hundred ten degrees (110°) Fahrenheit or lower.

11. Smoke detector system: Every dwelling unit shall be provided with approved
smoke detectors tested and installed in accordance with the Fire Prevention
Rules and Regulations of the State of Delaware and the Building Code of the City
of Seaford. When activated, the detector shall be tested in accordance with and
meet the requirements of the UL 217, Single and Multiple Station Smoke
Detectors.

§4.3.16 Responsibilities of Persons.

A

Cleanliness: Every occupant of a structure or part thereof shall keep that part of the
structure or premises thereof, which that occupant occupies, controls, or uses, in a
clean and sanitary condition. Every owner of a dwelling containing two (2) or more
dwelling units shall maintain, in a clean and sanitary condition, the shared or public
areas of the dwelling and premises thereof. The owner of the dwelling is responsible
for the cleaning of the occupant's area before the space is rented to the occupant.

Disposal of garbage: Every occupant of a structure or part thereof shall dispose of
garbage in a clean and sanitary manner, securely wrapping such garbage and placing
it in tight garbage storage containers as required by this code, or by such other
disposal method as may be required by applicable laws or ordinances.

Disposal of rubbish: Every occupant of a structure or part thereof shall dispose of all
rubbish in a clean and sanitary manner by placing it in rubbish containers, equipped
with tight fitting covers, as required by this Code.

Food preparation: All spaces used, or intended to be used for food preparation, shall
contain suitable space and equipment to store, prepare and serve food in a sanitary
manner. There shall be adequate facilities and services for the sanitary disposal of
food wastes and refuse, including facilities for temporary storage when necessary.

Furnished by occupant: The equipment and fixtures furnished by the occupant of a
structure shall be properly installed, and shall be maintained in good working
condition, kept clean and sanitary, and free of defects, leaks or obstructions.

Rubbish storage facilities: Every dwelling unit shall be supplied with approved
containers and covers for storage or rubbish, and the owner, operator or agent in
control of such dwelling shall be responsible for the removal of such rubbish.

Supplied fixtures and equipment: The owner or occupant of a structure or part
thereof shall keep the supplied equipment and fixtures therein clean and sanitary,
and shall be responsible for the exercise of reasonable care in their proper use and
operation.

§4.3.17 Extermination.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY QF SEAFORD

CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

§4.3.18

§4.3.19

§4.3.20

A

The owner of any structure shall be responsible for extermination of insects, rats,
vermin, rodents or other pests within the structure prior to renting, leasing, or selling
the structure.

1. Extermination procedures: The owner is responsible for making the structure
rodent proof. All baits used for extermination shall be used as stated on the
package label.

2. Multiple occupancy: Every owner, agent or operator of two (2) or more dwelling
units or multiple occupancies, or rooming houses, shall be responsible for the
extermination of any insects, rats or other pests in the public or shared areas of
the structure and premises.

3. Single occupancy: The occupant of a structure, containing a single dwelling unit,
shall be responsible for the extermination of any insects, rats, or other pests in
the structure or on the premises.

4. Tenant occupancy: The tenant-occupant of any structure shall be responsible for
the continued rodent proof condition of the structure, and if the tenant-occupant
fails to maintain the rodent proof condition, the cost of extermination shall be the
responsibility of the tenant-occupant.

Administration and enforcement.

A. The provisions of § 4.3.18 through § 4.3.33 shall govern the administration and

enforcement procedures of the City of Seaford Housing Code.

Administrative liability.

A

Any officer or employee, or member of the Board of Adjustment and Appeals, charged
with the enforcement of this Code, acting for the City in the discharge of his duties,
shall not thereby render himself liable personally, and he is hereby relieved from all
personal liability for any damage that may accrue to persons or property as a resuit of
any act required or permitted in the discharge of his duties under this Code.

No person who institutes, or assists in the prosecution of a criminal proceeding under
this Code, shall be liable for damage therefore, unless such person acted with actual
malice and without reasonable grounds for believing that the person accused or
prosecuted was guilty of an untawful act or omission.

Any suit brought against any officer, employee or agent or the City of Seaford
because of such act performed by him in the enforcement of any provision of this
Code shall be defended by the City Solicitor until the final determination of the
proceedings.

Conflict of interest.

A. No Officer or employee who has an official duty in connection with the administration

and enforcement of this Code shall be financially interested in the furnishing of labor,
materials or appliances for the construction, alteration or maintenance of a building
or in making the plans or specifications therefore, uniess that person is the owner of
such building.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

§4.321

§4.3.22

B. No such officer or employee shail engage in any activity which is inconsistent with the
public interest and the officer’s official duties.

C. Any member of a Board of Adjustment and Appeals, as established under Chapter 15
of the City Zoning Ordinance, who has a similar conflicting interest in the subject
matter on appeal, shall not participate in the voting; however, solely because that
member's vote is counted will not make the decision void or voidable if the Board of
Adjustment and Appeals, with or without knowledge of the material facts as to that
member's interest, decided in good faith by sufficient vote not counting the vote of
the interested Board of Adjustment and Appeals member.

Records.

A. The Building Official shall keep or cause to be kept records concerning the
enforcement of this Code's provisions, which records shall be open to public
inspection.

Duties and Powers of the Building Official.

A. The Building Official shall enforce all the provisions of this Code relative to the
maintenance of structures and premises, except as may otherwise be specifically
provided by other regulations.

1.

Access by owner or operator: Every occupant of a structure or premises shall give
the owner or operator thereof, or agent or employee, access to any part of such
structure or premises at reasonable times for the purpose of making such
inspections, maintenance, repairs or alterations as are necessary to comply with
the provisions of this Code.

Annual report: At least annually, the Building Officia! shall submit to the City
Manager a written statement of activities in a form and content as shall be
prescribed by the City Manager.

Credentials: The Building Official or the Building Official’s authorized
representative shall disclose proper evidence of their respective office for the
purpose of demonstrating authority to inspect any and all buildings and premises
in the performance of duties under this Code.

Inspections: In order to safeguard the safety, health and welfare of the public,
the Building Official is authorized to enter any structure or premises at any
reasonable time for the purpose of making inspections and performing duties
under this Code.

Notices and orders: The Building Official shall issue all necessary notices and
orders to abate illegal or unsafe conditions to insure compliance with the Code
requirements for the safety, health, and general welfare of the public.

Right of entry: If any owner or occupant, or other person in charge of a structure
subject to the provisions of this Code refuses, impedes, inhibits, interferes with,
restricts, or obstructs entry and free access to any part of the structure or
premises where inspection authorized by this Code is sought, the Building Official
may seek, in a court of competent jurisdiction, an order that such owner,
occupant or other such person in charge cease and desist with such interference.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

7. Rule making authority: The Building Official shall have power, as may be
necessary in the interest of public safety, health and general welfare, to adopt
and promulgate rules and regulations to interpret and implement the provisions
of this Ordinance to secure the intent thereof and to designate requirements
applicable because of local climatic or other conditions.

§4.3.23 Condemnation.

A

When a structure is found by the Building Official to be unsafe, or when a structure or
part thereof is found unfit for human occupancy or use, it may be condemned
pursuant to the provisions of this Code and may be placarded and vacated. Such
condemned structure shall not be reoccupied without approval of the Building
Official, but such approval may not be withheld upon completion of specified
corrections of violations.

Unsafe structure: An unsafe structure is one in which all or part thereof is found to
be dangerous to life, health, property, or the safety of the public or the structure’s
occupants because it is so damaged, decayed, dilapidated, structurally unsafe, or of
such fauity construction or unstable foundation that it is likely to partiatly or
completely collapse.

Unsafe equipment: Unsafe equipment includes any boiler, heating equipment,
elevator, moving stairway, electrical wiring or device, flammable liquid containers or
other equipment on the premises or within the structure, which is in such disrepair or
condition that is found to be a hazard to life, health, property or safety of the public or
occupants of the premises or structure. Unsafe equipment may contribute to the
finding that the structure is unsafe or unfit for human occupancy or use.

Structure unfit for human occupancy: A structure is unfit for human occupancy or
use whenever the Building Official finds that is unsafe, or because it lacks
maintenance and is in extreme disrepair, is unsanitary, vermin or rat infested,
contains filth and contamination, or lacks ventilation, illumination, sanitary or heating
facilities or other essential equipment required by this Code.

Closing of vacant structures: If the structure or part thereof is vacant and unfit for
human habitation, occupancy or use, and is not in danger of structural collapse, the
Building Official may post a placard of condemnation on the premises and may order
the structure closed up so it will not be an attractive nuisance to youngsters. Upon
failure of the owner to close up the premises within the time specified in the order,
the Building Official shall cause it to be closed through any available public agency or
by contract or arrangement by private persons and the cost thereof shall be charged
against the real estate upon which the structure is located and shall be a lien upon
such real estate in accordance with § 4.3.23 (F) of this Article.

Cost of closing by City; Payment by Owner:

1. When the City of Seaford has affected the closing of a vacant structure, by its
own employees or has paid for the closing of a vacant structure by its agents or
contractors, the actual costs thereof and any related expenses along with an
administrative fee of one hundred dolars ($100.00) shall be charged to the
owner of such property and, if not sooner paid, such charge will be carried on
the records of the City of Seaford and shall be collectible in the same manner as
real estate taxes are collected.

ARTICLE 3
HOUSING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

2,

4,

When the City of Seaford has, for the second time and any additional times at
such property, effected the removal of such vegetation by its own employees or
has paid for the removal of such vegetation by its agents or contractors, the
actual costs thereof and any related expenses along with an administrative fee
of five hundred dollars ($500.00) shall be charged to the owner of such property
and, if not sooner paid, such charge will be carried on the records of the City of
Seaford and shall be collectible in the same manner as real estate taxes are
collected.

Interest on all outstanding balances owed to the City shall be charged at the rate
of eighteen percent (18%) per annum to be applied thirty (30) days following the
date of completion of the work. if not paid by the owner or occupier thereto, said
bill shall be charged to the owner or occupier of such property.

After the closing, the Building Official shall cause to be recorded in the Finance
Department of the City a sworn statement showing the cost and expense incurred
for the work, the administrative fees, date the work was done and the location of
the property on which such work was done.

(a) The Finance Department shall charge these costs against the real estate
upon which the work was performed and bill the property owner for said
charges.

(b) Where the full amount due the City is not paid by such owner within thirty
(30) days, the City Solicitor shall file a lien against the property for all charges
including but not limited to administrative costs, court costs and reasonable
attorney's fees.

§ 4.3.24 Notices and Orders to owner or to person(s) responsible.

A. Whenever the Building Official determines that there has been a violation of this
Code or has reasonable grounds to believe that a violation has occurred, or whenever
the Building Official has condemned any structure or equipment under the provisions
of Section § 4.3.23 of this Article, notice shall be given to the owner or the person or
persons responsible therefore in the manner prescribed below. If the Building Official
has condemned the property or part thereof, the Building Official shall give notice to
the owner and to the occupants of the intent to placard and to order vacation of the
premises or to order equipment out of service.

B. Form: Such notice shall:

1

Be in writing;

Include a description of the real estate sufficient for identification;

Include a statement of the reason or reasons why it is being issued,

Include a correction order allowing a reasonable time for the repairs and
improvements required to bring the dwelling unit or structure into compliance
with the provisions of this Code;

Include an explanation of the owner's and/or occupant’s right to seek

modification or withdrawal of the notice by petition to the Housing Board of
Appeals; and

ARTICLE 3
HousiING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

6. State penalties for noncompliance.

C. Penaities: Failure to comply with orders and notices shall be subject to the penalties
set forth in § 4.3.27 of this article.

D. Service: Such service shall be deemed to be properly served upon such owner and
/or occupant if:

1. Copy thereof is delivered to the owner and/or occupant personally; or

2. By leaving the notice at the usual place of abode, in the presence of someone in
the family of suitable age and discretion, who shall be informed of the contents
thereof; or

3. By certified or registered mail addressed to the owner at the last known address
with return receipt requested; or

4. Iif the certified or registered letter is returned with receipt showing that is has not
been delivered, by posting a copy thereof in a conspicuous place on or about the
structure affected by such notice, and at least one (1) publication of such notice
in a local newspaper of general circutation.

E. Service on occupant: When a condemnation order is served on an occupant other
than the owner or person responsible for such compliance, a reasonable time to
vacate the property after noncompliance shall be stated. Owners or persons
responsible for compliance must vacate at the time set for correction of defects if
there is failure of compliance.

F. Transfer of ownership: It shall be unlawful for the owner of any dwelling unit or
structure, who has received a compliance order or upon whom a notice of violation
has been served, to sell, transfer, mortgage, lease or otherwise dispose of such
property to another until the provisions of the compliance order or notice of violation
has been complied with, or until such owner shall first furnish the grantee,
transferee, mortgagee or lessee a true copy of the compliance order or notice of
violation issued by the Building Official and shall furnish to the Building Official a
signed and notarized statement from the grantee, transferee, mortgagee or iessee,
acknowledging the receipt of such compliance order or notice of violation and fully
accepting the responsibility, without condition, or making the corrections or repairs
required by such compliance order or notice of violation.

§4.3.25 Piacarding.

A. Placarding of structure: After the condemnation notice required under the provisions
of this Code has resuited in an order by virtue of failure to comply within the time
given, the Building Official may post on the premises or structure, or parts thereof, or
on defective equipment, a placard bearing the words “Condemned As Unfit For
Human Occupancy Or Use”, and a statement of the penalties provided for any
occupancy or use or for removing the placard. The owner or the person or persons
responsible for the correction of violations and all other occupants shall remove
themselves from the property on failure to comply with the correction order in the
time specified.

ARTICLE 3
Housing CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

B. Prohibited use: Any person who shall occupy a placarded premises or structure or
part thereof, or shall use placarded equipment, and any owner or any person
responsible for the premises, who shall let anyone occupy a placarded premises,
shall be subject to the penalties set forth in § 4.3.27 of this article.

C. Removal of placard: The Building Official shall remove the condemnation placard
whenever the defect or defects upon which the condemnation and placarding action
were based have been eliminated. Any person who defaces or removes a
condemnation placard, without the approval of the Building Official, shall be subject
to the penalties provided by this Code.

§4.3.26 Emergency Orders.

A. Whenever the Building Official finds that an emergency exists on any premises, or in
any structure or part thereof, or on any defective equipment which requires
immediate action to protect the public’s health and safety or that of the occupants
thereof, the Building Official may, with proper notice and service in accordance with
the provisions of § 4.3.24 of this Article:

1. Issue an order reciting the existence of such an emergency; and
2. Requiring the vacating of the premises; or

3. Such action taken as the Building Official deems necessary to meet such
emergency; and

4. Notwithstanding other provisions of this Code, such order shall be effective
immediately, and the premises or equipment involved shall be placarded
immediately upon service of the order.

B. Hearing: Any person to whom such order is directed shall comply therewith. They
may thereafter, upon petition directed to the Housing Board of Appeals, be afforded a
hearing as prescribed in this Code. Depending upon the findings of the Housing
Board of Appeals at such hearing as to whether the provisions of this Code and the
Rules and Regulations adopted pursuant thereto have been complied with, the
Housing Board of Appeals shall continue such order or modify or revoke it.

§4.3.27 Violations.

A. Uniawful acts: It shall be uniawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect,
construct, alter, extend, repair, remove, demolish, use or occupy any structure or
equipment regulated by this Code, or cause same to be done, contrary to or in
conflict with or in violation of any of the provisions of this Code.

B. Penalty for violation: Any Person who shall violate any provision of this Code or who
fails to comply with any notice or order issued by the Building Official pursuant to the
provisions of this Ordinance, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction
thereof, shall be fined not less than twenty five dollars ($25.00) nor more than five
hundred dollars ($500.00) or imprisoned for a term not exceeding thirty (30) days or
both. Except where an appeal is taken, each day of a separate and continuing
violation shall be deemed a separate offense. The nearest Justice of the Peace Court
shall have exclusive and original jurisdiction over offences prosecuted under this
Code.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

C.

Prosecution: In case any violation order is not promptly complied with, the Building
Official may direct the City Solicitor to institute an appropriate action or proceeding at
law to seek the penalty provided in subsection (B) of this Section. Also, the Buiiding
Official may ask such legal representative to proceed at law or in equity against the
person responsible for the violation for the purpose of ordering that person:

1. To restrain, correct or remove the violation or refrain from any further execution
of work;

2. To restrain or correct the erection, installation, or alteration of such structure;

3. To require the removal of work in violation; or

4. To prevent the occupancy or use of the structure, or part thereof erected,
constructed, installed or altered in violation of, or not in compliance with, the

provisions of this code, or in violation of a plan or specification under which an
approval, permit or certification was issued.

§4.3.28 Right to appeal.

§4.3.29

A

Housing Board of Appeals, composition: The Housing Board of Appeals shall be the
Mayor and City Council.

Housing Board of Appeals, rules and regulations: The Housing Board of Appeals shall
make and adopt rules in accordance with the provisions of this Code.

Procedure for appeals: Any person aggrieved by an action taken by the Building
Official may appeal from such action by filing written notice of appeal with the
Housing Board of Appeals within ten (10) days after the giving or posting of notice of
such action. An appeal under this subsection shall stay the effect of the Notice of
Violation or Condemnation and shall prevent the Building Official from proceeding
with the remedies provided under this Code pending decision by the Housing Board
of Appeals. An appeal to the Superior Court by an aggrieved person from a decision
of such Housing Board of Appeals shall be made in the manner provided for appeals
from administrative decisions.

Vote: A Housing Board of Appeals shall hear all appeals relative to the enforcement
of this Code within its jurisdiction within a reasonable period of time after the filing of
an appeal, and by concurring vote of the majority of its members may reverse or
affirm wholly or partly, or may modify, the action appealed from and shall make such
other order or determination as it deems just. Failure to secure such concurring
votes shall be deemed a confirmation of the decision of the Building Official.

Financial interest: A member of the Housing Board of Appeal shall not participate in
any hearings or vote on any appeal in which that member has a direct or indirect
financial interest.

Records: The Housing Board of Appeals shall keep a written or recorded record of
each meeting showing clearly the basis for each decision made by the Board.

Demolition.

A. The Building Official may order the owner of premises upon which is located any

structure or part thereof, which in the Building Official's judgment is so old,

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

dilapidated or has become so out of repair as to be dangerous, unsafe, unsanitary or
otherwise unfit for human habitation, occupancy or use, so that it would be
unreasonable to repair the same, to raze and remove such structure or part thereof;
or, if it can be made safe by repair, to repair and make safe and sanitary or to raze
and remove at the owner’s option; or where there has been a cessation of normal
construction of any structure for a period of more than one (1) year, to raze and
remove such structure or part thereof.

B. Order: The order shall specify a time in which the owner shall comply therewith and
specify repairs if any. It shall be served on the owner of record or an agent where an
agent is in charge of the building and upon the holder of any lien in the manner
provided for service of a summons by a court of record. If the owner or a holder of a
lien of record cannot be found, the order may be served by posting it on the main
entrance of the building and by publishing it once each week, for three (3) successive
weeks, in a newspaper of general circulation in accordance with the rules of the
Superior Court.

1. Restraining actions: Anyone affected by any such order may, within thirty (30)
days after service of such order, apply to a court of record for an order restraining
the Building Official from razing and removing such structure or parts thereof.
The court shall determine whether the order of the Building Official is reasonable
and, if found unreasonable, the court may issue a restraining order.

2, Failure to comply: Whenever the owner of a property fails to comply with a
demolition order within the time prescribed, the Building Official shall cause the
structure or part thereof to be razed and removed, either through an available
public agency or by contract or arrangement with private persons, and the cost of
such razing and removal shall be charged against the real estate upon which the
structure is located and shall be a lien upon such real estate as provided in
§4.3.31.

3. Salvage materials: When any structure has been ordered razed and removed,
the Building Official or other designated officer may sell the salvage and valuable
materials resulting from such razing or removal, such materials to be sold at the
highest price obtainable. The net proceeds of such sale, after deducting the
expenses of such razing and removal, shall be promptly remitted with a report of
such sale or transaction, including the items of expense and the amounts
deducted, for the use of the person who may be entitled thereto, subject to any
order of a court. If such a surplus does not remain to be turned over, the report
shall so state.

§4.3.30 Cost of removal by City; Payment by Owner.

A. When the City of Seaford has affected the razing, demolition, removal or abatement
of other unsafe conditions constituting a threat to the public health and safety, by its
own employees or has paid for the razing, demolition, removal or abatement of other
unsafe conditions constituting a threat to the public health and safety by its agents or
contractors, the actual costs thereof and any related expenses along with an
administrative fee of five hundred dollars ($500.00) shall be charged to the owner of
such property and, if not sooner paid, such charge will be carried on the records of
the City of Seaford and shall be collectible in the same manner as real estate taxes
are collected.

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 4 - BUILDINGS

§4.331

§4.3.32

§4.3.33

Interest on all outstanding balances owed to the City shall be charged at the rate of
eighteen percent (18%) per annum to be applied thirty (30) days following the date of
completion of the work. if not paid by the owner or occupier thereto, said bill shall be
charged to the owner or occupier of such property.

Creation of Tax Lien.

A

There is hereby created a tax lien on real property for monies expended by the City
for razing, demolition, removal or abatement of other unsafe conditions constituting
a threat to the public health and safety, including any administrative fees, where the
responsible party refuses or fails to comply with the lawful order of the Building
Official after due notice thereof, either actual or constructive. Upon certification of a
tax lien to the appropriate City Official by the Building Official, the amount of such lien
shall be recorded and collected in the same manner as other City real estate taxes
and paid to the City when collected.

Severability.

A

If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase of this Code shall
be declared invalid for any reason whatsoever, such decision shall not affect the
remaining portions of this Code which shall continue in full force and effect; and to
this end the provisions of this Code are hereby declared to be severable.

Saving Clause.

A

The Code shall not affect violations of any other Ordinance, Code or regulation of the
City of Seaford existing prior to the effective date hereof, and any such violation shall
be governed and shall continue to be enforced to the full extent of the law under the
provisions of such Ordinances, Codes, or regulations in effect at the time the
violation was committed. This Code shall take effect immediately upon its adoption
by majority vote of all members of the City Councit of Seaford, Sussex County,
Delaware.

§ 4.3.34 through § 4.3.99 RESERVED

END OF CHAPTER

ARTICLE 3
HousING CODE



m’(‘bﬁz
\O'%»\\

ORDINANCE #2019-?2?

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD, an ordinance to amend
Chapter 9, of the Municipal Code of Seaford, Delaware relating to “Plumbing”, in the manner

following, to wit:

Chapter 9, Article 1, of the Municipal Code of Seaford, Delaware is hereby amended by striking out
all of said ARTICLE 1 and substituting in lieu thereof a new ARTICLE 1 to read as shown on the
following pages.

?2?/?2/2019 Date of First Reading

?27/?2/2019 Date of Second Reading & Adoption

?272/72/2019 Date of Advertisement

?2?2/?2/2019 Date the Ordinance is Effective

CITY OF SEAFORD

By: Witness:
Mayor

Attest:
City Manager




CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

ARTICLE 1 - PLUMBING CODE

[Amended on 09/13/2011 by Ordinance #2011-03]
{Amended on 00/00/0000 by Ordinance #0000-00]

§9.1.1  Title. This article shall be known as the “Plumbing Code of the City of Seaford, Delaware”.

§9.1.2  Adoption of Plumbing Code.

A

The International Plumbing Code, 2609-2018 edition with amendments, including
Appendix Chapters B,C, D, and E;and-F, as published by the International Code
Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City of Seaford, in the
State of Delaware for regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of
materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement,
addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing systems as herein provided; providing
for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Plumbing Code on file
in the office of the Building Official of the City of Seaford are hereby referred to,
adopted, and made a part hereof, as if they were fully set out in this ordinance, with
the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in § 9.1.3 of this
Code.

At least one (1) copy of the Plumbing Code shall be on file in the office of the City
Building Official for public inspection and use.

Any and all existing ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby
repealed.

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any
reason, held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining
portions of this ordinance. The City of Seaford hereby declares that it would have
passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof,
irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared invalid.

Nothing in this ordinance or in the Plumbing Code hereby adopted shall be construed
to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or
liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act
or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in § 9.1.2 (C) of this ordinance; nor shall any
just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this
ordinance.

The City Manager is hereby ordered and directed to cause this ordinance to be
published.

This ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and
effect thirty (30) days from and after the date of its advertisement in a newspaper of
local circulation.

§9.1.3 Amendments to the 2009-2018 International Plumbing Code.

A. The following sections are hereby revised:

ARTICLE 1
PLUMBING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

1. §101.1 Delete: INAME-OFJURISDIGHON], Insert: City of Seaford, Delaware

2.

§ 102 Insert at end of section: §102.12 City of Seaford Standard Design
Specifications. The most current edition of the City of Seaford
Standard Design Specifications are hereby a referenced part of this
code and as such are enforceable under this code.

§ 102.7 Delete:-this-code-fornew-installations:, Insert: §105.54.1 of this
code.

§ 103 Delete Title: DEPARTMENT-OFRLUMBINGINSRECHON, Insert: CODE
DEPARTMENT

§ 103.1 Delete: department-of plumbing-inspestion, Insert: Code Department
Delete: eode-offieiad, Insert: Building Official

Insert at the end of the paragraph: All references within this Code, to
“Department of Plumbing Inspection”, are hereby deleted and
replaced with “Code Department”. All references within this Code, to
“code official”, are hereby deleted and replaced with “Building
Official”.

§ 103.2 Delete:

au%hent—y—ef—t—he-}&nsd%en Insert The Buuldlng Offlmal shall be hlred
by the City Manager

§ 105.54. 1Delete Mateﬂaﬁ—equmeﬂt—anddewees-shau—net—bﬁeused-m

Insert No permlts shall be
issued by the Building Official unless the structure to be erected,
constructed, enlarged, altered, repaired, moved or emplaced shall be
of new materials and equipment.

§ 106.6.2 Delete: indicated-in-the-following-schedule-PURISDICHON-TOINSERT
ARRRORRIATE-SCGHEBULE], Insert: established by City Council.

§ 106.6.3 Delete: Feerefunds—The-code-official-shal-authorize-therefundingof

ARTICLE 1
PLUMBING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

Insert: Deleted.
10.8§ 108.4  Delete: [SPEGIFY-OFRENSE], Insert: misdemeanor
Delete: fAMOUNT}-dollars, Insert: five hundred dollars ($500.00)

Delete: INUMBER-OF-BAYS], Insert: ten (10)
11.8§ 108.5 Delete: (AMOUNT-dolars, Insert: one hundred dollars ($100.00)

Delete: fAMOUNT-delars, Insert: five hundred dollars ($500.00)

12.§ 109.2

been-appeinted—Insert: The board of appeals shall consist of three
members appointed by the Mayor and Council.

13.§ 109.2.1 Delete:-offive-individualsr-one-from-each-of-the-followingprefessions

we;k—lnsert members who are qualrfled by experience and tralnlng to
pass on matters pertaining building construction and plumbing
installation. Board members shall not be employees of the City of
Seaford.

14. §109.2.2 Delete 1he—eh+ef—eppe+n%mg—a&thwﬁy—shaﬂ—appemt—twe—a+temate

has—been—appem%ed— Insert The Mayor and Councﬂ shaII appomt one
alternate member who shall be called by the board Chairman to hear
appeals during the absence or disqualification of a member.

15. § 109.2.3 Delete:-Chairman—TFhe-board-shall-annually-selest-one-ofits-members
to-serve-as-chairman:, Insert: Board meetings; records.

ARTICLE 1
PLUMBING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

A. Meetings of the Board shall be held at the call of the Chairman
and at such other times, as the Board may determine.

B. The Chairman or in his absence, the acting chairman, may
administer oaths and compel the attendance of witnesses.

C. All meetings of the Board shall be open to the public.

D. The Board shall keep minutes of its proceedings, showing the
vote of each member upon each question, or if absent or failing to
vote, indicating such fact, and shall keep records of its
examinations and other official actions.

E. The record shall be immediately filed in the City office and shall
be a public record.

16. § 109.2.4 Delete: Bisqualification-ef-member-A-membershallnot-hearan

Linwhich-t! bort | professional
finanecialinterest:, Insert: Rules adoption. The Plumbing Board of
Appeals shall make and adopt rules in accordance with the provisions
of this Chapter.

17. § 109.2.5 Delete: Secretary—TFhe-chief-administrative-officershall-designatea

qﬂuahllled s_Ilellle to sslluegas"sesletally. o tl'ne bl ea'?r Illeﬁsel G'EEIa.”FSI'a"
administrative-officer- Insert: Filing fee for appeal. A fee, as
determined by the Mayor and Council, shall accompany each appeal
to the Plumbing Board of Appeals.

18. § 109.2.6 Delete: Gompen nbers—Compensation-of-membe

19.§ 109.3
20.§ 109.4
21.§ 109.4.1
22.§ 109.5
23.§ 109.6
24.§ 109.6.1
25.§ 109.6.2

26. § 202

be—detemmed—by—law— Insert Heanngs The Board shaII fix a
reasonable time for the hearing of the appeal, give public notice
thereof, as well as due notice to the parties in interest, and by mail to
the registered owners of the next five (5) properties adjoining or
adjacent, in each direction, to the property upon which the appeal
centers. The appeal shall be decided within a reasonable time not to
exceed sixty (60) days from the date of the filing of such appeal. Upon
the hearing, any party may appear in person or by agent or by
attorney, provided that the agent or attorney produces authorization
from his principal for acting in such a capacity.

Delete section in its entirety., Insert: Deleted.
Delete section in its entirety., Insert: Deleted.
Delete section in its entirety., Insert: Deleted.
Delete section in its entirety., Insert: Deleted.
Delete section in its entirety., Insert: Deleted.
Delete section in its entirety., Insert: Deleted.
Delete section in its entirety., Insert: Deleted.

Insert: Solvent Cement. This code prohibits the use of all purpose
glue in any reference to solvent cement.

ARTICLE 1
PLUMBING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

Insert: Supervision of Work. Work completed under the permit of a
licensed plumber while employed by the licensed plumber, or the
same firm, partnership, corporation, or owners of the company as the
licensed plumber,

27.8305.64.1 Delete: INUMBERHRehes{mmy, Insert: twenty four (24)

inches

Delete: (NUMBER}-Hnrehes{mim)}, Insert: twenty four (24) inches

28.8312.4 Delete section in its entirety., Insert: Deleted.

Insert:

A. Every building in which plumbing fixtures are installed and all
premises having drainage piping shall be connected to a public
sewer.

B. Building sewers, when installed by any person, firm or corporation
other than the municipality, its agents, servants or employees, or
by an independent contractor under contract with the City, shall
be of approved materials listed in the City of Seaford Standard
Design Specifications, from the public sewer to the clean out
inside the curb line.

C. When an existing sewer lateral does not have a clean out
installed at the curb line, the property owner shall be responsible
for the cost of all construction, installation, maintenance and/or
repair of the building sewer from the building to the public sewer,
including the wye branch, tap and any and all street repairs
associated with said work.

D. When a sewer lateral is installed with a clean out at the curb line,
the property owner shall be responsible for the cost of all
construction, installation, maintenance and/or repair of the
building sewer on private property from the building to the
cleanout wye branch at the curb line. Downstream from this point,
the City shall be responsible for the cost of all construction,
installation, maintenance and/or repair of the sewer lateral,
including the wye branch, tap and any and all street repairs
associated with said work.

ARTICLE 1
PLUMBING CODE



CoODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

32.30. §9043.1 Delete: INIMBER}HRehes{mm), Insert: six (6) inches
33.31. §9178.1 Insert at end of paragraph: The use of Air Admittance Valves

shall only be permitted when specifically approved by the Building Official prior to
use or installation.

§ 9.1.4 through §9.1.99 RESERVED

ARTICLE 1
PLUMBING CODE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER S - PLUMBING

ARTICLE 2 - PLUMBER LICENSE
[Amended on 09/13/2011 by Ordinance #2011-03]

§9.2.1

§9.2.2

§9.2.3

§9.2.4

§9.25

§9.2.6

Title.

This Article shall be known as the “Plumber Licensing Ordinance of the City of Seaford,
Delaware”.

Applicability.

This Article shall apply to all Plumbers performing work within the incorporated
boundaries of the City of Seaford, Delaware.

Intent and purpose.

The purpose of this Article is to promote the health, safety, and general welfare of the
citizens of the City of Seaford. The City Council is designated as the lead agency charged
with the administration and enforcement of this article, and may appoint such persons to
assist in the administration and enforcement of this article as it deems appropriate.

Plumber; license required.

A. Before any person, firm or corporation shall engage in plumbing business, he shall be
qualified as set forth herein, and a license shall be obtained from the City and State
as required and a proper Bond posted.

B. Where any plumbing work is being done, a Master or Journeyman Plumber shall be
present at all times on the job and in actual control and in charge of the work being
done.

Installation by owner; exception.

A. Nothing in this Article shall prevent any homeowner from installing or maintaining
plumbing within his own property boundaries, providing such plumbing work is done
by himself and is used exclusively by him or his family.

B. Such privilege does not convey the right to violate any of the provisions of this
Chapter, nor is it to be construed as exempting any such property owner from
obtaining a permit and paying the required fees.

C. Any homeowner obtaining a permit for such work must reside in the dwelling for a
minimum of 12 months after the permit is closed out.

License application; contents.

A. Any Master Plumber who desires a license required by §9.2.4 shall make an
application in writing to the City Manager on forms provided by the City.

B. The application shall set forth the following information:

1. The name, address and telephone number of the principal office of the Master
Plumber;

ARTICLE 2
PLUMBER LICENSE



CoDE OF THE CITY OF SEAFQORD CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

§9.2.7

§9.2.8

§9.2.9

§9.2.10

§9.2.11

2. The name, address and telephone number of the Company the Master Plumber
will be working under;

3. The Master Plumber's name and address;
4. The names of all Journeyman Plumber working under the Master Plumber;

5. Include a copy of the State of Delaware License for all Master and Journeyman
Plumbers.

License fee; payment.

A

B.

C.

The annual license fee shall be as determined by City Council.

The Plumber Licensing period runs for one (1) year starting December 1st and expires
on November 30th of the following year.

Licensing fees are not prorated.

Qualification of Plumber.

Applicants for a City Plumber License must hold a current, valid Plumber License issued
by the State of Delaware. The State License must be kept current and valid until the
expiration of the City Plumber License.

Bond required.

A

Before any person, firm, or corporation shall engage in the business of plumbing, he,
it or they shall first obtain the proper license and deposit with the City a good and
sufficient bond in the sum of Five Thousand Dollars ($5,000), to be approved by the
City Solicitor, conditioned that the person, firm, or corporation engaged in the
plumbing business will faithfully observe all the laws pertaining to plumbing, drain
laying, and excavation; further, that the City shall be indemnified and saved harmless
from all claims arising from accidents and damage of any character whatsoever
caused by the negligence of such person, firm, or corporation engaged in the
plumbing business or by any other unfaithful, inadequate work done either by
themselves or their agents or employees, and that such person, firm or corporation
will maintain in a safe condition for a period of one (1) year all ditches, excavations
and road repairs, which may be opened in the performance of any plumbing work,
and further that all dirt and other material, excavated will be replaced in good
condition with similar materials.

Where such excavation is made in an unpaved street, or any street paved with chert,
macadam, asphalt or concrete, the word “street” as herein used, shall apply to
sidewalks, curbs, gutters and street paving.

Issuance of License.

A License may only be issued after the applicant has fully complied with this Article.

Ilegal Work; Revocation of License.

A. Any person, firm, or corporation engaged in plumbing business whose work does not

conform to the codes and specifications of the City, or whose workmanship or

ARTICLE 2
PLUMBER LICENSE



CODE OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD CHAPTER 9 - PLUMBING

materials are of inferior quality shall on notice from the Building Official make
necessary changes or corrections at once so as to conform to this Code; if work has
not been so changed after ten (10) days notice from the Building Official, the Building
Official shall then refuse to issue any more permits until such work has fully complied
with the codes and specifications of the City.

B. The Building Official may appear before the City Council and request that a license be
revoked because of continuous violations.

C. When the revocation of any such license is to be considered at any meeting, the
person, firm, company, association, or corporation to whom the license has been
issued shall have at least three (3) days’ notice in writing of the time and place of
such meeting, together with a statement of the grounds upon which it is proposed to
revoke such license.

§9.2.12 Allowing ones name, License, or Bond to be used to obtain Permit fraudulently.
No person, firm or corporation engaged in the business of plumbing shall allow his, its’ or
their names to be used by any other person, firm or corporation, directly or indirectly to
obtain a permit, or for the construction of any work under his, its’ or their names, license
or bond; nor shall he, it or they make any misrepresentations or omissions in his, its’ or
their returns.

§ 9.2.13 through § 9.2.99 RESERVED

END OF CHAPTER

ARTICLE 2
PLUMBER LICENSE



P =

e o
MEMORANDUM ©- 214

To: Mayor & City Council Members

Fr: Charles Anderson, City Manager §"
Trisha Newcomer, ED and CR Director

Re: GMB Office Renovations — 400 High Street
Dt: 9/26/19

Recently, Trisha and I spoke to Judy Schwartz, P.E. at George Miles and Burh, about
potential renovations to their office building. The request is to fit out the second floor of
the building they rent from the City, located at 400 High Street.

Judy shared with us, due to the growth of her firm, they have a need for additional office
space. The renovations of the second floor would be to accommodate up to seven new
employees and provide additional bathroom amenities.

The scope of work would generally be:

1. Demo and remove the old carpeting, paneling and trim.

Install new electrical outlets, lighting and switches, as necessary to accommodate
the proposed layout of the space.

Install new drywall and paint.

Install new fixtures, flooring and vanity in the existing bathroom space.

Install new ceiling in the entire area.

Install new carpet throughout the second floor.

Provide new HVAC system for the area.

N~

NowneWw

The estimated cost for theses renovations would be approximately $40,000.

We discussed with Judy the extension of their lease, as we are currently on a year-to-year
term. She agreed in principal to this and would revise the existing lease documents for
our review. We discussed a term of two years with additional extensions and an annual
2% escalator. Once a final draft of the lease has been prepared it will be presented to the
Council for consideration.

We did review the existing lease rates currently being paid by GMB. They are currently
leasing the entire building for $43,140 annually or $10.33/ (gross) square foot. In
discussing this rate with local real-estate professionals, the average leasing rates for
office space in the area is between $8 and $12/square foot. It should also be noted that
second floor walkup office space is typically less desirable and therefore would be
toward the lower end of the average.



Staff would recommend we consider the request of our tenant, George, Miles and Buhr,
LLC and work with them to affect the renovations to the second floor of 400 High Street
to accommodate additional office space on the second floor. The funding for these
renovations could be provided by GMB rent reserves currently on hand with the City.

If approved, the City would work with GMB to obtain plans and specifications suitable
for permitting and bidding. Upon obtaining competitive bids from qualified contractors
we would bring the information back to the City Council for approval and contract
issuance.

Should you have any questions please contact Trisha or myself.

Thank you.



TRINITY

ABURRISLOGISTICS COMPANY

September 27, 2019 &‘f‘-’%‘(’
TSR \

City of Seaford

Attn: Tracy Torbert

414 High Street

Seaford DE 19973

Dear Tracy,

First, | wanted to thank the City of Seaford for reaching out to Trinity for the
opportunity to be part of the 9-1-1 planning committee. It was relayed to me
that the meetings would be held on Tuesdays, but was not aware that the
meetings would be after hours. Unfortunately, with other commitments | have,
my Tuesday evenings are pretty-well spoken for.

| have asked my colleague, Amanda Lloyd, to represent Trinity and she would
be excited to do so.

Again, thank you for considering our company to be a part of this and best
wishes for the committees' endeavors.

Sincerely,

%sey, Trinity Logistics

50 FALLON AVE. SEAFORD DE 800-846-3400  TRINITYLOGISTICS.COM




s ™\

VO -y - \\
MEMORANDUM

To: Mayor & City Council Members

Fr: Charles Anderson, City Managerq‘
Re: City Charter Limits — Floating Debt
Dt: 9/27/19

At the regular Council meeting on September 24", staff was requested to provide
additional information related to the historical changes in floating debt limits.

The City Clerk, Tracy Torbert and I located the attached documents from City archives:

1. The Charter of the City of Seaford Approved May 5, 1961; Reprinted to Include
Charter Amendments to Date.... January 25, 1982

2. The Municipal Code of Seaford, DE 1973

3. House of Representatives 144" General Assembly House Bill No.98; 3/22/2007

The documentation available to us provided the following history of the floating debit
limits (corresponding to the information cited above):

1. 1982 (or earlier) “not exceeding Two Hundred Thousand Dollars ($200,000) in
any fiscal year.

2. 1988 (or earlier) “not exceeding Seven Hundred Fifty Thousand Dollars
(8750,000) in any fiscal year.

3. 2007... “Two Million Dollars ($2,000,000) .

Should you have any additional questions please contact Tracy or .

Thank you.



10

11

12

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

SPONSOR: Rep. D. Short & Sen. Venables

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
144th GENERAL ASSEMBLY

HOUSE BILL NO. 98
AN ACT TO AMEND VOLUME 53, CHAPTER 42, LAWS OF DELAWARE, AS AMENDED, ENTITLED "AN ACT
AMENDING, REVISING AND CONSOLIDATING THE CHARTER OF THE CITY OF SEAFORD" RELATING TO
TAXES, DEBTS, CONTRACTS AND FINANCING.
BE IT ENACTED BY THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY OF THE STATE OF DELAWARE:

Section 1. Amend Section 4(A), Volume 53, Chapter 42, Laws of Delaware, as amended, by striking the figure
“$5,000,000,000” as it appears therein and substituting in lieu thereof “$5,000,000”.

Section 2. Amend Section 14, Volume 53, Chapter 42, Laws of Delaware, as amended, by adding a new
subsection “9” to read as follows:

“9. Contracts in which the City Council directly contracts for the procurement of labor or
material for public improvements for the benefit of a special development district or a tax increment
financing district created or designated by the Council. The provision includes a contract between
the City Council and an owner of real property located in a special development district or tax
increment financing district which provides for the transfer to the City Council from the owner of
work performed by and the cost of labor or materials provided by the owner for the benefit of the
district.”.

Section 3. Amend Section 14, subsection (1), Volume 53, Chapter 42, Laws of Delaware, as amended, by striking
the figure “Ten Thousand Dollars ($10,000.00)” as it appears therein and substituting in lieu thereof “Twenty-five
Thousand Dollars ($25,000)”.

Section 4. Amend Section 27, Volume 53, Chapter 42, Laws of Delaware, as amended, by adding a new
subsection “(T)” to read as follows:

“(T) The provisions of this Section shall apply to all special ad valorem taxes and special taxes levied
by the Town Council pursuant to Section 34A, provided that all references to this Section to an
Annual Tax List shall, for all purposes relating to such special ad valorem taxes and special taxes,
be deemed to refer to the Tax List showing the amounts of special ad valorem taxes or special
taxes levied against the real property within a special development district.”.

Page 1 of 2

HR:PEV : MFL Released: 03/22/2007 01:47 PM
3041440021



22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42

43

Section 5. Amend Section 27(A), Volume 53, Chapter 42, Laws of Delaware, as amended, by striking the figure
“$2,000,000” as it appears therein, and substituting in lieu thereof “$5,000,000”.

Section 6. Amend Section 35, Volume 53, Chapter 42, Laws of Delaware, as amended, by adding a new
subsection “(H)” to read as follows:

“(H) All provisions of this Section and any other Section of this Charter limiting the amounts of
indebtedness to be incurred or taxes to be levied by the City Council shall not apply to any indebtedness incurred or any
special ad valorem taxes, special taxes, or ad valorem taxes levied pursuant to or in connection with Section 37A of this
Charter.”.

Section 7. Amend Section 37, Volume 53, Chapter 42, Laws of Delaware, as amended, by striking “Seven
Hundred Fifty Thousand Dollars ($750,000)” as it appears therein and substituting in lieu thereof “Two Million Dollars
($2,000,000)”.

Section 8. Amend Section 37A, Volume 53, Chapter 42, Laws of Delaware, as amended, by redesignating
existing Section “37A” as new Section “37B” and establishing a new Section “37A” to read as follows:

“Section 37A. Tax Increment Financing and Special Development District.

In addition to all other powers, the City Council may have, and notwithstanding any limitation of
law, the City Council shall have all powers and may undertake all actions for the purposes set forth in, and
in accordance with Chapter 17, Title 22 of the Delaware Code, relating to the Municipal Tax Increment
Financing Act, and Chapter 18, Title 22 of the Delaware Code, relating to Special Development
Districts.”.

Section 9. If any provision of this Act or the application thereof to any person at circumstances is held invalid, the
invalidity does not affect other provisions or applications of the Act which can be given effect without the invalid provision
or application; and, to that end, the provisions of this Act are declared to be severable.

SYNOPSIS

Section 1. The proposed change is to correct an error in the Charter and to restate that the correct figure is Five
Million Dollars ($5,000,000.00). This Section addresses the sale of City property without special election.

Section 2. The proposed change increases the maximum limit that City Council can raise as taxes in any one
year from Two Million Dollars ($2,000,000.00) to Five Million Dollars ($5,000,000.00).

Section 3. The proposed change increases the maximum limit of floating debt from Seven Hundred Fifty
Thousand Dollars ($750,000.00) to Two Million Dollars ($2,000,000.00).

Section 4 thru 7. The proposed changes authorize the City to utilize the provisions of the Municipal Tax
Increment Financing Act and establish special development districts and modify other charter provisions to implement said
changes.

Section 8. The proposed change increases the maximum contract amount not subject to competitive bidding
from Ten Thousand Dollars ($10,000.00) to Twenty-Five Thousand Dollars ($25,000.00).

Section 9. Sections are severable.

Page 2 of 2
HR :PEV : MFL Released: 03/22/2007 01:47 PM
3041440021



= b
B
> .

LY “ﬁwﬁ
\" »

THE MUNICIPAL CODE
of
SEAFORD, DELAWARE
1973

THE CHARTER
AND
GENERAL ORDINANCES OF THE CITY

PUBLISHED BY ORDER OF THE CITY COUNCIL

Boid ivg OFFicalls

-

NIMLO
WASHINGTON, D.C.
1973



Charter of the City of Seaford 61

stay proceedings upon the decision appealed from, but the Court may, on
application, on notice to the City Council and on due cause shown, grant a
restraining order. The Court may reverse or affirm, wholly or partly, or may
modify the decision brought up for review.

FLOATING DEBT.

Section 37. The City Council of the City of Seaford shall have full power
and authority to anticipate revenue by borrowing upon the faith and credit of
The City of Seaford the sum or sums of, not exceeding Seven Hundred Fifty
Thousand Dollars ($750,000) in any one fiscal year, when, in the opinion of
the majority of the said City Council, the needs of the City of Seaford demand
it. The City Council may secure such sum or sums of money so borrowed by
promissory notes of the City executed by the Mayor and attested by the Secre-
tary of City Council, either with or without the corporate seal of The City of
Seaford affixed as is requested by the Bank or persons advancing the money
on said notes, and no officer or Councilman shall be personally liable for the
payment of such note because it is signed by them as officers or Councilmen
of The City of Seaford, and is authorized by the Resolution of the City
Council; provided, however, that any sum of money borrowed on the faith and
credit of The City of Seaford, as aforesaid, in any fiscal year, shall be paid out
of the general funds of the City at the minimum rate of ten per centum (10%)
per fiscal year and shall be completely paid at the end of ten (10) fiscal years
following the first fiscal year which said money was borrowed with the in-
terest thereon, and no part of the principal of nor the interest on any borrowing
authorized by this Section shall be taxable by the State of Delaware nor any
political subdivision thereof.

SURVIVAL OF POWER AND VALIDATING SECTION.

Section 38. This Act shall operate to amend, revise and consolidate, "An
Act Changing the Name of the Town of Seaford to the City of Seaford, and Es-
tablishing a Charter Therefor," being Chapter 184, Volume 43, Laws of Dela-
ware, and the various amendments and supplements thereto and to repeal all
such parts of said Act and its amendments and supplements as are manifestly
inconsistent with the provisions of this Act. All powers conferred upon or
vested in the City of Seaford and/or the City Council of the City of Seaford by
any Act of Law of the State of Delaware not in conflict with the provisions of



CHARTER
OF THE

CITY OF SEAFORD

SUSSEX COUNTY, DELAWARE

APPROVED MAY 5, 1961

Reprinted To Include Charter Amendments To Date
May 1977
June 30, 1979
January 25, 1982




Charter of the City of Seaford ) 61
FLOATING DEBT.

Section 37. The City Council of the City of Seaford shall have full power and
authority to anticipate revenue by borrowing upon the faith and credit of The
City of Seaford the sum or sums of, not exceeding Two Hundred Thousand
Dollars ($200,000) in any one fiscal year, when, in the opinion of the majority
of the said City Council, the needs of the City of Seaford demand it. The City
Council may secure such sum or sums of money so borrowed by promissory
notes of the City executed by the Mayor and attested by the Secretary of City
Council, either with or without the corporate seal of The City of Seaford affixed
as is requested by the Bank or persons advancing the money on said notes, and
no officer or Councilman shall be personally liable for the payment of such note
because it is signed by them as officers or Councilmen of The City of Seaford,
and is authorized by the Resolution of the City Council; provided, however,
that any sum of money borrowed on the faith and credit of The City of Seaford,
as aforesaid, in any fiscal year, shall be paid out of the general funds of the City
at the minimum rate of ten per centum (10%) per fiscal year and shall be com-
pletely paid at the end of ten (10) fiscal years following the first fiscal year
which said money was borrowed with the interest thereon, and no part of the
principal of nor the interest on any borrowing authorized by this Section shall
be taxable by the State of Delaware nor any political subdivision thereof.

SURVIVAL OF POWER AND VALIDATING SECTION.

Section 38. This Act shall operate to amend, revise and consolidate, “An Act
Changing the Name of the Town of Seaford to the City of Seaford, and
Establishing a Charter Therefor,” being Chapter 184, Volume 43, Laws of
Delaware, and the various amendments and supplements thereto and to repeal
all such parts of said Act and its amendments and supplements as are mani-
festly inconsistent with the provisions of this Act. All powers conferred upon or
vested in the City of Seaford and/or the City Council of the City of Seaford by
any Act of Law of the State of Delaware not in conflict with the provisions of
this Charter, are hereby expressly conferred upon, and vested in the City of
Seaford and/or the City Council of the City of Seaford, precisely as if each of
the said powers was expressly repeated in this Charter. All ordinances and
resolutions heretofore lawfully enacted or adopted by the City Council of the
City of Seaford and in force at the time of the approval of this Charter shall
continue in full force and effect until the same or any of them shall be repealed,
modified or altered by the City Council of the City of Seaford under the provi-
sions of this Charter; all the acts and doings of the Council of said City or of any




	Agenda
	Correspondence #1
	New Business #1
	DOC049
	DOC050
	DOC051

	New Business #2
	New Business # 3
	New Business #4
	Old Business #1
	DOC052
	DOC053


